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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/034319-2024 

Not applicable

Management Services for the new Dundee Life
Sciences Innovation Hub and Dundee University
Incubator

University of Dundee

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-034319

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04a62a  

Published 23 October 2024, 2:20pm

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

University of Dundee

Procurement, 3rd Floor, Tower Building, Nethergate

Dundee

DD1 4HN

Contact

Allan Tough

Email

Procurement@dundee.ac.uk

Telephone

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/034319-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/034319-2024
mailto:Procurement@dundee.ac.uk
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+44 1382386810

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM71 - Angus and Dundee City

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.dundee.ac.uk

Buyer's address

https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA0010
5

http://www.dundee.ac.uk
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA00105
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA00105
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Management Services for the new Dundee Life Sciences Innovation Hub and Dundee
University Incubator

Reference number

UoD-PF169-TC-2024

II.1.2) Main CPV code

70332200 - Commercial property management services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The purpose of this Contract Notice is to invite tenders for the provision of services for the
Leasing and Management of the new Dundee Life Sciences Innovation Hub and the current
Dundee University Incubator building.

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2024/S 000-031997

Section VII. Changes

VII.1) Information to be changed or added

VII.2) Other additional information

/Notice/031997-2024
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Details of University of Dundee presentation and tour to potential suppliers on 31st Oct
2024

Date: Thursday 31st October, 2pm

Location: Seminar Room. University of Dundee Centre for Targeted Protein Degradation 
https://www.dundee.ac.uk/locations/centre-targeted-protein-degradation, 1 James Lindsay
Place, Dundee, DD1 5JJ

Please report to the Centre for Targeted Protein Degradation reception upon arrival.

A 45min presentation will be provided by the University of Dundee outlining the
management services required and provide further background information. This will be
followed by a tour of both the Innovation Hub and Incubator buildings. The University wishes
to make all suppliers aware that in the interests of transparency, any questions that are
raised either during the presentation or during the tour will be shared on the PCS portal (with
the University response to those questions) with all suppliers that have noted interest.

The University reserves the right to record any questions received during the presentation
and tour.

Please note: As the Innovation Hub is still under construction, personal protective
equipment will be required for the tour (will be provided by the University). The University
would politely request that all suppliers intending to attend in person provide their name and
a note of their shoe size (for PPE purposes). There will be the opportunity for suppliers to
also join the presentation remotely. Please provide the contact email address of those to be
added to the presentation appointment for virtual attendance.

Visitor parking spaces are available by downloading the Ringo app and using visitor code
12650.

The Centre for Targeted Protein Degradation is located within walking distance of Dundee
train station and is also a short 10 min taxi journey from Dundee Airport.

If there are any questions regarding arrangements for the site visit, please contact 
a.m.tough@dundee.ac.uk
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