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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/032866-2022 

Planning

SACT e-Consent

The Common Services Agency (more commonly known as NHS National Services Scotland)
("NSS")

F01: Prior information notice

Prior information only  

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-032866

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-0386bc  

Published 18 November 2022, 5:03pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

The Common Services Agency (more commonly known as NHS National Services Scotland)
("NSS")

Gyle Square (NSS Head Office), 1 South Gyle Crescent

Edinburgh

EH12 9EB

Contact

Ope Ore

Email

ope.ore@nhs.scot

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/032866-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/032866-2022
mailto:ope.ore@nhs.scot
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.nss.nhs.scot/browse/procurement-and-logistics

Buyer's address

https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA11883

I.2) Information about joint procurement

The contract is awarded by a central purchasing body

I.3) Communication

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

http://www.nss.nhs.scot/browse/procurement-and-logistics
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA11883
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

SACT e-Consent

II.1.2) Main CPV code

72000000 - IT services: consulting, software development, Internet and support

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Cancer Research UK (CRUK) has an extensive consent form library (in PDF format) used for
Systemic Anti-Cancer Therapy (SACT).The Scottish Government (SG) has engaged NHS
National Services Scotland (NSS) to deliver an electronic consent form application that can
integrate multiple digital signatures into various forms held within a Document management
system.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

72000000 - IT services: consulting, software development, Internet and support

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

Main site or place of performance

Scotland
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II.2.4) Description of the procurement

NHS National Services Scotland is exploring the options for the possible procurement of an
electronic consent form application with digital content management and to further
understand the current landscape and capabilities.

The Scottish Government (SG) has engaged NHS National Services Scotland (NSS) to
deliver an electronic consent form application that can integrate multiple digital signatures
into various forms held within a Document management system.

The initial use case is for the solution to standardise the process for adult SACT consent
across Scotland, with the potential of expanding the scope to include further use cases and
should be capable of being rolled out to other clinical specialties over time such as paediatric
SACT, clinical trials, radiotherapy, or surgery.

The solution will enable the completed form and the data for each completed SACT form to
be integrated into each patient's medical record and support Public Health Scotland (PHS)
in the collection and analysis of SACT data in partnership with Cancer Research UK.

Patients receiving SACT therapy may have to travel between health boards for treatment. As
such, ensuring visibility of the consent form to patients and appropriate health professionals
who need to view it, while ensuring robust security and patient confidentiality are essential
requirements.

II.3) Estimated date of publication of contract notice

30 January 2023

Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

Interested suppliers can download the questionnaire attached to this notice. Please follow
the instructions in the document.

NOTE: To register your interest in this notice and obtain any additional information please
visit the Public Contracts Scotland Web Site at 
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/Search/Search_Switch.aspx?ID=713721.

(SC Ref:713721)
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