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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/031863-2022 

Contract

Central Venous Catheters

The Common Services Agency (more commonly known as NHS National Services Scotland)
("NSS")

F03: Contract award notice

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-031863

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03831f  

Published 10 November 2022, 3:00pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

The Common Services Agency (more commonly known as NHS National Services Scotland)
("NSS")

Gyle Square (NSS Head Office), 1 South Gyle Crescent

Edinburgh

EH12 9EB

Email

patrick.mulraney@nhs.scot

Telephone

+44 1698794410

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/031863-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/031863-2022
mailto:patrick.mulraney@nhs.scot
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.nss.nhs.scot/browse/procurement-and-logistics

Buyer's address

https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA11883

I.2) Information about joint procurement

The contract is awarded by a central purchasing body

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Central Venous Catheters

Reference number

NP10622

II.1.2) Main CPV code

http://www.nss.nhs.scot/browse/procurement-and-logistics
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA11883
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33141200 - Catheters

II.1.3) Type of contract

Supplies

II.1.4) Short description

The Common Services Agency (more commonly known as National Services Scotland) (‘the
authority') acting through its division Procurement, Commissioning and Facilities is
undertaking this procurement of supply and delivery of Central Venous Catheters on behalf
of all entities constituted pursuant to the National Health Service (Scotland) Act 1978 (i.e.
All NHS Scotland Health Boards, Special Health Boards and the Authority of other NHS
Organisation established pursuant to the NHS (Scotland) Act 1978), any integrated Joint
Boards established pursuant to the new Public Bodies (Joint Working) Scotland Act 2014
(collectively hereafter referred to as 'Participating Authorities’). The main supply route for
these products will be via the NDC (National Distribution Centre) based in Larkhall South
Lanarkshire.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: Yes

II.1.7) Total value of the procurement (excluding VAT)

Value excluding VAT: £8,570,103

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Coated Central Venous Catheters

Lot No

1

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance
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NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Coated Central Venous Catheter (CVC) which will minimise the risk of infection
and is for use

in, but not limited to; administering medication or fluids that are unable to be taken by mouth
or would harm a smaller peripheral vein, to obtain blood tests and to measure central venous
pressure.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and

describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges and Lumens.

This Lot will be a Multi Supplier Unranked Framework, where we envisage seven suppliers to
be awarded.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title
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Non-Coated Central Venous Catheters

Lot No

2

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Non Coated Central Venous Catheter (CVC) for use in, but not limited to; for
use in; administering

medication or fluids that are unable to be taken by mouth or would harm a smaller peripheral
vein, to obtain

blood tests and to measure central venous pressure.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across

NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and describing the product. This product is required in varyinglengths, gauges
and Lumens.

This Lot will be a Multi Supplier Unranked framework, where we envisage seven participants
to be awarded.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 
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II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Paediatric Central Venous Catheters

Lot No

3

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Paediatric Central Venous Catheter (CVC) for use in, but not limited to;
administering medication or fluids that are unable to be taken by mouth or would harm a
smaller peripheral vein, to obtain blood tests and to measure central venous pressure.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and# describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges
and Lumens.

This lot will be a Multi Supplier Unranked Framework, where we envisage seven Suppliers to
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be awarded.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Midline Catheters

Lot No

4

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Midline Catheter for longer term IV access which is ideal for patients whose
treatment is expected to last more than three (3) days.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
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environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges
and Lumens.

Lot 4 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as a Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Skin Tunnelling Catheters

Lot No

5

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland
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II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Skin Tunnelling Catheter suitable for long term insertion for use in, but not
limited to; taking a blood sample, giving medication, giving blood or blood products, giving
chemotherapy, intravenous feeding, bone marrow transplantation, and photopheresis.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges
and Lumens.

Lot 5 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this Lot as a Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Antimicrobial PICC Lines

Lot No

6

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)
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33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Antimicrobial (Peripherally Inserted Central Catheter) PICC Line, which is used
for a prolonged period of time for Chemotherapy or Antibiotic therapy along with the
administration of substances that should not be done

peripherally.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and

describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges and Lumens.

Lot 6 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as a Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description
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II.2.1) Title

Non Coated PICC's

Lot No

7

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Non Coated (Peripherally Inserted Central Catheter) PICC Line, which is used
for a prolonged period of time for Chemotherapy or Antibiotic therapy along with the
administration of substances that should not be done

peripherally.

The product should have the required functionality to allow use across the varying
environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and

describing the product. This product is required in varying lengths, gauges and Lumens.

Lot 7 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as a Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training & Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 



Page 12 to 67

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Standard Arterial Line (Seldinger)

Lot No

8

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Seldinger Arterial Line, which can be inserted in a variety of arteries, the most
common sites for

placement being the radial and the femoral artery.

The product should have the required functionality to maximise insertion life and minimise
the risk of failed

insertion across the varying environments found across NHS Scotland in a Acute and
Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
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protecting and

describing the product.

Lot 8 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Single Use IV Saline Pre Filled Syringes

Lot No

10

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement
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We require a range of Single Use IV Saline Prefilled Syringes (in various sizes) which are
designed to help prevent vascular access systems blockage and to clear any medication that
may be left at the catheter site which will be used by clinically trained personnel across NHS
Scotland.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and describing the product.

Lot 10 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

CVC Insertion Packs

Lot No

11

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes
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UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a CVC Insertion Pack that will contain a range of different consumable products
that will be used for central line Insertion by suitably trained personnel across NHS Scotland.
The contents of these packs will be agreed with Health Boards on an individual basis.

Lot 11 - We envisage seven suppliers being awarded to this lot as a Multi supplier unranked
award.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training/Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Implantable Ports

Lot No

12

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes
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UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a range of Implantable Ports and associated Needles which NHS Scotland give IV
treatments and blood transfusions directly into a vein, which allows easy access to a vein for
blood draws. Patients with with cancer, severe infections, kidney failure and IBD may need
implanted ports which are implanted by suitably trained personnel across NHS Scotland.

Lot 12 - We envisaged seven suppliers being awarded to this lot as a multi supplier unranked
award.

Potential framework suppliers to are awarded to one or more lots, can list their range of
products here as this lot will not be scored nor evaluated.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training & Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Arterial Cannula (Non Seldinger)

Lot No

9

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

33141200 - Catheters
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II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - Scotland

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

We require a Non Selindger Arterial Cannula which is designed for insertion into peripheral
arteries, allowing the for the determination of blood gas estimations or monitoring blood
pressure.

The product should have the required functionality to maximise insertion life and minimise
the risk of failed insertion across the varying environments found across NHS Scotland in a
Acute and Community Environment.

Product must be Single Use, Sterile and Latex Free and be delivered in suitable packaging
protecting and describing the product.

Lot 9 — We envisage that seven suppliers will be awarded to this lot as Multi Supplier
Unranked Framework.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Training & Support / Weighting: 30

Price - Weighting: 70 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.3) Information about a framework agreement or a dynamic purchasing
system

The procurement involves the establishment of a framework agreement

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2022/S 022-191439

https://ted.europa.eu/udl?uri=TED:NOTICE:191439-2022:TEXT:EN:HTML
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

1

Title

Coated Central Venous Catheters

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 3 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 3 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL
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Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA

Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £716,570
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

11

Title

CVC Insertion Packs

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 6 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 6 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

pfm medical UK Limited

Suite 3, Armcon Business Park, , Poynton

Cheshire

SK12 1LQ

Telephone

+44 1625875388

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LTD

3rd Floor Quayside, , erspool Business Park

Greenalls Avenue, Warrington

WA4 6HL

Telephone

+44 1565748337

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD61 - Warrington

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Molnlycke Health Care

Unity House, Medlock Street

Oldham

OL1 3HS

Telephone
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+44 1908355242

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £643,195
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

10

Title

Single Use IV Saline Pre Filled Syringes

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 5 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 5 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS
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Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fannin (UK) Ltd. Part of DCC Vital

Westminster Industrial Estate, Repton Road, Measham

Swadlincote

DE12 7DT

Telephone

+44 035312907197

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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B. Braun Medical Limited

B. Braun Medical Limited, Thorncliffe Park

Sheffield

S35 2PW

Telephone

+44 1142259132

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE32 - Sheffield

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

GBUK Healthcare Ltd

Blackwood Hall Business Park, North Duffield

Selby

YO8 5DD

Telephone

+44 1757288587

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LTD

3rd Floor Quayside, , erspool Business Park

Greenalls Avenue, Warrington

WA4 6HL

Telephone

+44 1565748337

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD61 - Warrington

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £153,496
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

12

Title

Implantable Ports

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 7 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 7 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fannin (UK) Ltd. Part of DCC Vital

Westminster Industrial Estate, Repton Road, Measham

Swadlincote

DE12 7DT

Telephone

+44 035312907197

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

B. Braun Medical Limited

B. Braun Medical Limited, Thorncliffe Park

Sheffield

S35 2PW

Telephone

+44 1142259132

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE32 - Sheffield

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Medical Access Limited

The Heath Business Park

Runcorn

WA7 4QX

Telephone
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+44 8000272889

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD6 - Cheshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

pfm medical UK Limited

Suite 3, Armcon Business Park, , Poynton

Cheshire

SK12 1LQ

Telephone

+44 1625875388

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £250,000
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

2

Title

Non-Coated Central Venous Catheters

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 5 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 5 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Merit Medical UK Ltd.

Unit 27 Suttons Business Park, Sutton Park Avenue, Earley

Reading

RG6 1AZ

Telephone

+44 800973115

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Pharmed UK

Cephalon House, , Unit 8 Manor Pk,

Banbury,

OX16 3TB

Telephone

+44 8454500590

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ14 - Oxfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £716,570
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

3

Title

Paediatric Central Venous Catheters

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 5 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 5 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Pharmed UK

Cephalon House, , Unit 8 Manor Pk,

Banbury,

OX16 3TB

Telephone

+44 8454500590

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ14 - Oxfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £381,454
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

4

Title

Midline Catheters

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 7 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 7 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fannin (UK) Ltd. Part of DCC Vital

Westminster Industrial Estate, Repton Road, Measham

Swadlincote

DE12 7DT

Telephone

+44 035312907197

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

B. Braun Medical Limited

B. Braun Medical Limited, Thorncliffe Park

Sheffield

S35 2PW

Telephone
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+44 1142259132

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE32 - Sheffield

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Medical Access Limited

The Heath Business Park

Runcorn

WA7 4QX

Telephone

+44 8000272889

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD6 - Cheshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £460,593



Page 49 to 67

Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

6

Title

Antimicrobial PICC Lines

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 3 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 3 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA



Page 50 to 67

Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £3,431,938

Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

5

Title

Skin Tunnelling Catheters

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract
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V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 2 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 2 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £436,994
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

8

Title

Standard Arterial Line (Seldinger)

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 6 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 6 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

B. Braun Medical Limited

B. Braun Medical Limited, Thorncliffe Park

Sheffield

S35 2PW

Telephone

+44 1142259132

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code



Page 57 to 67

UKE32 - Sheffield

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

GBUK Healthcare Ltd

Blackwood Hall Business Park, North Duffield

Selby

YO8 5DD

Telephone

+44 1757288587

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Merit Medical UK Ltd.

Unit 27 Suttons Business Park, Sutton Park Avenue, Earley

Reading

RG6 1AZ

Telephone
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+44 800973115

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £999,283
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Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

7

Title

Non Coated PICC's

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 7 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 7 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kimal plc

Arundel Road, Uxbridge

Middlesex

UB8 2SA
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Telephone

+44 8454379542

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Vygon (UK) Ltd

The Pierre Simonet Building, V Park, Gateway North, Latham Road

Swindon

SN25 4DL

Telephone

+44 1793748800

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ

Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fannin (UK) Ltd. Part of DCC Vital

Westminster Industrial Estate, Repton Road, Measham

Swadlincote

DE12 7DT

Telephone

+44 035312907197

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Medical Access Limited

The Heath Business Park

Runcorn

WA7 4QX

Telephone
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+44 8000272889

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD6 - Cheshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

pfm medical UK Limited

Suite 3, Armcon Business Park, , Poynton

Cheshire

SK12 1LQ

Telephone

+44 1625875388

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £333,820



Page 64 to 67

Section V. Award of contract

Lot No

9

Title

Arterial Cannula (Non Seldinger)

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

25 October 2022

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 3 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 1 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 3 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Teleflex

Grosvenor House, 7 Horseshoe Crescent

Old Town Beaconsfield

HP9 1LJ
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Telephone

+44 7423459580

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Becton Dickinson U.K. Limited

1030 Eskdale Road, Winnersh Triangle

Wokingham

RG41 5TS

Telephone

+44 1189216348

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Fannin (UK) Ltd. Part of DCC Vital

Westminster Industrial Estate, Repton Road, Measham

Swadlincote

DE12 7DT

Telephone

+44 035312907197

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Total value of the contract/lot: £174,274

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

The values in Sections II.1.5 and II.2.6 cover the full duration of the framework including any
extension options that may be exercised.

(SC Ref:711904)

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body
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Sheriff Court House

27 Chambers Street

Edinburgh

EH11 1LB

Telephone

+44 1312252525

Country

United Kingdom

VI.4.3) Review procedure

Precise information on deadline(s) for review procedures

The bringing of court proceedings against the Authority after the Framework Agreement has
been entered into will not affect the

Framework Agreement unless grounds for the imposition of special penalties under the
Public Contracts(Scotland) Regulations 2015 can be

established. Otherwise the remedies that may be awarded by the courts where the
Framework Agreement has been entered into are limited to

the award of damages.
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