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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/030211-2023 

Tender

Hostile Vehicle Mitigation

The City of Edinburgh Council

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-030211
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03c4ec  
Published 13 October 2023, 11:00am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

The City of Edinburgh Council

Waverley Court, 4 East Market Street

Edinburgh

EH8 8BG

Contact

Kyro Grieve

Email

kyro.grieve@edinburgh.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/030211-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/030211-2023
mailto:kyro.grieve@edinburgh.gov.uk
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UKM75 - Edinburgh, City of

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.edinburgh.gov.uk

Buyer's address

https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA0029
0

I.2) Information about joint procurement

The contract is awarded by a central purchasing body

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk

Electronic communication requires the use of tools and devices that are not generally
available. Unrestricted and full direct access to these tools and devices is possible, free of
charge, at

https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

General public services

http://www.edinburgh.gov.uk
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA00290
https://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA00290
https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk
https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk
https://www.publictendersscotland.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Hostile Vehicle Mitigation

Reference number

CT2967

II.1.2) Main CPV code

34923000 - Road traffic-control equipment

II.1.3) Type of contract

Supplies

II.1.4) Short description

The City of Edinburgh Council is seeking a supplier who can provide rental of rated hostile
vehicle mitigation equipment and associated works to support the security of events and
public spaces. Acceptable ratings are IWA-14 or PAS68

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £240,000

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

45233291 - Installation of bollards

34928450 - Bollards

34923000 - Road traffic-control equipment

45316213 - Installation of traffic guidance equipment
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63712700 - Traffic control services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM75 - Edinburgh, City of

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The City of Edinburgh Council is seeking a supplier who can provide rental of rated hostile
vehicle mitigation equipment, deployment of the equipment and provide associated
services to support the security of events and public spaces. The equipment must be
suitable for deployment in high-traffic areas, including pedestrian permeable solutions.
The supplier must also provide storage and deployment options.

The rental period for the equipment will vary depending on the individual event needs, and
suppliers must be able to provide flexible rental terms to accommodate these varying
requirements.

Interested suppliers should upload their submissions via the Public Contract Scotland
Tender Website/ portal. Further tender information can be found via Public Contract
Scotland Tender.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: quality / Weighting: 70

Price - Weighting: 30 

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Duration in months

24

This contract is subject to renewal

Yes

Description of renewals

The contract may be extended by a further two, twelve month periods following the initial
two years at the sole discretion of the Council

II.2.10) Information about variants
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Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

Section III. Legal, economic, financial and technical information

III.1) Conditions for participation

III.1.2) Economic and financial standing

List and brief description of selection criteria

Tenderers are required to have a minimum “general” annual turnover of 50000GBP for
the last two financial years. Where a Tenderer does not have an annual turnover of this
value, the Council may exclude the Tenderer from the competition or may apply discretion
seeking supporting evidence to determine the Tenderer’s suitability to proceed in the
competition.

Tenderers will be required provide the following information:

Current ratio for Current Year: 1.15

Current ratio for Prior Year: 1:15

The formula for calculating a Tenderer’s current ratio is current assets divided by current
liabilities. The acceptable range for each financial ratio is greater than 1.15. Where a
Tenderer’s current ratio is less than the acceptable value, the Council may exclude the
Tenderer from the competition or may apply discretion seeking supporting evidence to
determine the Tenderer’s suitability to proceed in the competition.

Minimum level(s) of standards possibly required

Minimum “general” annual turnover of 120000GBP for the last two financial years.

Current ratio for Current Year: 1.15
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Current ratio for Prior Year: 1:15

Employer’s Liability Insurance (minimum of 5 Million GBP)

Public Liability Insurance (minimum of 10 Million GBP)

Where a Tenderer does not hold or commit to obtaining the types and levels of insurance
indicated, the Council will exclude the Tenderer from the competition.

III.1.3) Technical and professional ability

List and brief description of selection criteria

It is a mandatory requirement of this Framework that a prompt payment clause is present
in all Contracts used in the delivery of the requirements. This ensures payment of sub-
contractors at all stages of the supply chain within 30 days and includes an obligation to
provide a point of contact for sub-contractors to refer to in the case of payment difficulties.
This will require active monitoring of payment

performance as well as the provision of evidence and reports to the Council on request or
as contractually scheduled. Tenderers will be required to provide evidence that their
organisation has taken steps to build their awareness of the climate change emergency
and how they will respond. Accepted evidence includes but is not limited to: A completed
copy of “Climate Change Plan” including planned projects and actions to reduce the
bidder’s carbon emissions. This does not need to contain calculated carbon emissions.
Where a Tenderer’s response is of a less than the acceptable standard, the Council may
exclude the Tenderer from the competition or may

apply discretion seeking supporting evidence to determine the Tenderer’s suitability to
proceed in the competition. It is a mandatory requirement that Tendering Organisations
with more than 5 employees have in place a Health & Safety Policy which is approved at
a senior level within the Organisation and is reviewed regularly. Bidders should confirm
that this condition has been met within the response to this question. Where a Bidder
does not have a Health & Safety Policy and is required to do so, the Council may exclude
the Bidder from the competition.
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.3) Information about a framework agreement or a dynamic purchasing system

The procurement involves the establishment of a framework agreement

Framework agreement with a single operator

IV.1.6) Information about electronic auction

An electronic auction will be used

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2023/S 000-012219

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

13 November 2023

Local time

2:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.6) Minimum time frame during which the tenderer must maintain the tender

Duration in months: 4 (from the date stated for receipt of tender)

/Notice/012219-2023


Page 8 to 10

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

13 November 2023

Local time

2:00pm

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.2) Information about electronic workflows

Electronic ordering will be used

Electronic invoicing will be accepted

Electronic payment will be used

VI.3) Additional information

It is a mandatory requirement of this Framework Agreement that a prompt payment clause
is present in all Contracts used in the delivery of the requirements. This ensures payment
of sub-contractors at all stages of the supply chain within 30 days and includes an
obligation to provide a point of contact for sub-contractors to refer to in the case of
payment difficulties. This will require active monitoring of payment performance as well as
the provision of evidence and reports to the Council on request or as contractually
scheduled.

The buyer is using PCS-Tender to conduct this ITT exercise. The Project code is 25379.
For more information see: 
http://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/info/InfoCentre.aspx?ID=2343

Community benefits are included in this requirement. For more information see: 
https://www.gov.scot/policies/public-sector-procurement/community-benefits-in-
procurement/

A summary of the expected community benefits has been provided as follows:

http://www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk/info/InfoCentre.aspx?ID=2343
https://www.gov.scot/policies/public-sector-procurement/community-benefits-in-procurement/
https://www.gov.scot/policies/public-sector-procurement/community-benefits-in-procurement/
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As detailed in the Council’s Sustainable Procurement Policy, the Council is committed to
maximising social, economic and environmental benefits through the delivery of Council
contracts (known as ‘Community Benefits’). Community benefits include targeted
recruitment and training; sourcing from Small and Medium Enterprises (SMEs), Social
Enterprises and Third Sector Organisations; contributions to education within
communities; community consultation, engagement and strengthening of community
relations; environmental improvement; volunteering; providing community resources;
mentoring and sponsorship of community organisations.

The Council will work in partnership with the successful Provider on supporting the
Edinburgh Guarantee’s vision of increasing the number and range of employment
opportunities or other support available for the city’s young people. Further information on
the Edinburgh Guarantee can be found at 
http://www.edinburgh.gov.uk/info/20163/opportunities_for_young_people/69/edinburgh_g
uarantee

(SC Ref:747284)

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Sheriff Court

Sheriff Court House, 27 Chambers Street

Edinburgh

EH1 1LB

Country

United Kingdom

VI.4.3) Review procedure

Precise information on deadline(s) for review procedures

An economic operator that suffers or risks suffering loss or damage attributable to a
breach of duty under Public Contracts (Scotland) Regulations 2015 may bring
proceedings in the Sheriff Court or Court of Session. . A claim for an ineffectiveness order
must be made within 30 days of the Contract Award Notice being published in the Find a
Tender Service /OJEU or within 30 days of the date those who expressed an interest in or
otherwise bid for the contract were informed of the conclusion of the contract or in any
other case within 6 months from the date on which the contract was entered into.

http://www.edinburgh.gov.uk/info/20163/opportunities_for_young_people/69/edinburgh_guarantee
http://www.edinburgh.gov.uk/info/20163/opportunities_for_young_people/69/edinburgh_guarantee
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