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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/028309-2022 

Tender

Organisational and Strategy Development for Black
Country Integrated Care Board

NHS Black Country Integrated Care Board

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-028309
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-037412  
Published 7 October 2022, 4:07pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

NHS Black Country Integrated Care Board

Civic Centre, St Peter's Square

Wolverhampton

WV1 1SH

Contact

Michael Barlow

Email

michael.barlow1@nhs.net

Country

United Kingdom

Region code

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/028309-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/028309-2022
mailto:michael.barlow1@nhs.net
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UKG3 - West Midlands

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.ardengemcsu.nhs.uk/

Buyer's address

https://uk.eu-supply.com/ctm/Company/CompanyInformation/Index/68205

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=53607&B=AGCSU

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=53607&B=AGCSU

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted to the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

https://www.ardengemcsu.nhs.uk/
https://uk.eu-supply.com/ctm/Company/CompanyInformation/Index/68205
https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=53607&B=AGCSU
https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=53607&B=AGCSU
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Organisational and Strategy Development for Black Country Integrated Care Board

Reference number

BCICB-ODSD

II.1.2) Main CPV code

79400000 - Business and management consultancy and related services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The Black Country ICS is seeking to commission a partner that can offer both strategic
and organisational development in an NHS care context that will work with the ICS, ICB
and the greatest asset at the NHS’s disposal, its people (in accordance with ‘Our
approach to working with people and communities’ – see attached). Any OD partner
should be cognisant of our commitment to work together with our people and communities
and is able to support the system leaders to see the importance of this approach as we
develop as an ICB/ICS.

The preferred partner will be able to demonstrate a track record of asset-led, people
powered change, that they have a wide range of skills and capabilities and have the
mechanisms and flexibilities to both adapt their support over time, as the ICS evolves; as
well as be able to demonstrate how they can secure additional expertise from relevant
specialists as and when this is needed.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £550,000

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description
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II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

79411000 - General management consultancy services

79411100 - Business development consultancy services

79414000 - Human resources management consultancy services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKG3 - West Midlands

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The Black Country Integrated Care Board (ICB) was established on 1 July 2022 when the
Black Country and West Birmingham Clinical Commissioning Group (CCG) was
abolished. They are part of the Black Country Integrated Care System (ICS), known as
Healthier Futures, working to bring health and social care services closer together for the
good of our communities.

The Black Country ICS is seeking to commission a partner that can offer both strategic
and organisational development in an NHS care context that will work with the ICS, ICB
and the greatest asset at the NHS’s disposal, its people (in accordance with ‘Our
approach to working with people and communities’ – see attached). Any OD partner
should be cognisant of our commitment to work together with our people and communities
and is able to support the system leaders to see the importance of this approach as we
develop as an ICB/ICS.

The preferred partner will be able to demonstrate a track record of asset-led, people
powered change, that they have a wide range of skills and capabilities and have the
mechanisms and flexibilities to both adapt their support over time, as the ICS evolves; as
well as be able to demonstrate how they can secure additional expertise from relevant
specialists as and when this is needed.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.6) Estimated value

Value excluding VAT: £550,000

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system
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Duration in months

24

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section III. Legal, economic, financial and technical information

III.1) Conditions for participation

III.1.1) Suitability to pursue the professional activity, including requirements relating to
enrolment on professional or trade registers

List and brief description of conditions

All professional and/or trade registrations are specified within the tender documentation.

III.1.2) Economic and financial standing

List and brief description of selection criteria

Financial standing requirements for the Procurement are outlined within Document 1 - ITT
Process Overview, Section 9.4 Financial Standing

Minimum level(s) of standards possibly required

Financial standing requirements for the Procurement are outlined within Document 1 - ITT
Process Overview, Section 9.4 Financial Standing

III.1.3) Technical and professional ability

List and brief description of selection criteria

All technical capacity and its evaluation criteria are specified within the tender
documentation.
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

7 November 2022

Local time

5:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

7 November 2022

Local time

5:00pm
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

High Court

Strand

London

WC2A 2LL

Country

United Kingdom
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