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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/026417-2023 

Planning

Substance Misuse Services

Leicestershire Police

F01: Prior information notice

Prior information only  

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-026417

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03faa6  

Published 7 September 2023, 9:51am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Leicestershire Police

Police Headquarters, St. Johns, Enderby

Leicestershire

LE19 2BX

Contact

Alex Branson

Email

alex.branson@leics.police.uk

Telephone

+44 1162222222

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/026417-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/026417-2023
mailto:alex.branson@leics.police.uk
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Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

National registration number

N/A

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.leics.police.uk/

Buyer's address

https://uk.eu-supply.com/ctm/Company/CompanyInformation/Index/30501

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=72681&B=BLUELIGHT

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Public order and safety

https://www.leics.police.uk/
https://uk.eu-supply.com/ctm/Company/CompanyInformation/Index/30501
https://uk.eu-supply.com/app/rfq/rwlentrance_s.asp?PID=72681&B=BLUELIGHT
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Substance Misuse Services

II.1.2) Main CPV code

90743200 - Toxic substances rehabilitation services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The current contract for the OPCC for Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland is to be
recommissioned for a new service relating to Substance Misuse. This service is required, to
provide services to offenders living in Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland (LLR) requiring
Substance Misuse services, including Activities in Custody, Out of Court Resolutions
(Conditional Cautions/Community Resolutions) including a Drugs and Alcohol Education
and Support Programme, and ProActive Vulnerability and Engagement (known as PAVE).

As part of the recommissioning activity, we are looking to hear from other providers who
have knowledge and experiences with this kind of service. For us to gain as much information
as possible as we shape the new specification, we request that you complete the below
questionnaire to the best of your ability. This is also an early opportunity to submit your
interest in the future tendering exercise.

Please return questionnaires to: OPCC_commissioningteam@leics.police.uk

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

90743200 - Toxic substances rehabilitation services

mailto:OPCC_commissioningteam@leics.police.uk
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II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The current contract for the OPCC for Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland is to be
recommissioned for a new service relating to Substance Misuse. This service is required, to
provide services to offenders living in Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland (LLR) requiring
Substance Misuse services, including Activities in Custody, Out of Court Resolutions
(Conditional Cautions/Community Resolutions) including a Drugs and Alcohol Education
and Support Programme, and ProActive Vulnerability and Engagement (known as PAVE).

As part of the recommissioning activity, we are looking to hear from other providers who
have knowledge and experiences with this kind of service. For us to gain as much information
as possible as we shape the new specification, we request that you complete the below
questionnaire to the best of your ability. This is also an early opportunity to submit your
interest in the future tendering exercise.

II.3) Estimated date of publication of contract notice

1 January 2024

Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes
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