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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025953-2024 

Planning

Hampshire Physical Activity Service

HAMPSHIRE COUNTY COUNCIL

F21: Social and other specific services – public contracts

Prior information notice without call for competition  

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-025953

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-048b2b  

Published 15 August 2024, 12:13pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

HAMPSHIRE COUNTY COUNCIL

The Castle

WINCHESTER

SO238ZB

Contact

Alix Holmes

Email

alix.holmes@hants.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1962845979

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025953-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025953-2024
mailto:alix.holmes@hants.gov.uk
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Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UKJ36 - Central Hampshire

Justification for not providing organisation identifier

Not on any register

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.hants.gov.uk/

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

Health

https://www.hants.gov.uk/
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Hampshire Physical Activity Service

Reference number

AS24986

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Background

Hampshire County Council is undertaking some pre market engagement in August 2024 for
the provision of a physical activity service to be delivered to residents across Hampshire.  

The objectives of the proposed service are to:  

a. To provide an evidence-based, physical activity intervention enabling inactive adults in
Hampshire to become active for a period of 12 weeks or more  

b. To contribute to reducing health inequalities in Hampshire by targeting the locations and
groups of people with the greatest levels of inactivity.  

c. To deliver a high quality service that is responsive to the requirements of the priority
groups and maximises retention from enrolment to completion  

d. To maximise sustained behaviour change at the end of the intervention period  

The Council is looking to undertake market engagement with potential providers of this
service. This is with the aim of: 
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• Gaining a better understanding of the market and gauging what level of interest might exist
within the provider market for delivering this service 

• Understanding the market capability and the feasibility of the proposed intervention in
relation to locations, target populations and costs 

• Obtain comments in relation to success measures and KPIs 

• Gain a better understanding of the approach to insight and co-design that providers may
wish to take 

• Give providers an opportunity to share information that may be relevant to the final service
specification 

Market Engagement Event

The Council would like to invite potential providers to attend a Microsoft Teams event on
Monday 2nd September 2024 at 1pm. The purpose of the event is to discuss the service,
understand the market able to deliver the service and to support understanding of how to bid
for the tender when the opportunity is live. 

Potential providers of the service that wish to attend the event should register on The
Councils e-tendering platform In-Tend Hampshire County Council Electronic Tendering Site -
Home (in-tendhost.co.uk), it is free to register.

Once registered please go to the 'Tenders' button, 'Current' and search for the project
reference 'AS24986' and follow the on screen instructions. 

To attend the event please send the name and email address of the person from your
organisation who will be attending the event via the 'Correspondence' button so they can be
emailed the invitation to the event. This must be done by Thursday 29th August 5pm. 

Market Engagement Documents

The Council have provided further details of the proposed service in a draft specification to
help provide information about the proposed service as we would like potential providers to
complete and submit a market engagement questionnaire. 

Both the draft specification and the market engagement questionnaire can be accessed from
the 'synopsis' button once you have accessed the project via In-Tend. 

Please return you questionnaire via the 'correspondence' button by Thursday 29th August
5pm.

https://in-tendhost.co.uk
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Please note: Completion of the market engagement questionnaire is not intended to confer
any advantage to those providers who respond should there subsequently be any future
tender exercise relating to the proposed service. The distribution of the market engagement
questionnaire also does not guarantee any future tender competition. Respondents are
requested to read and compete the Declaration on the final page of the Market Engagement
Questionnaire document.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £900,000

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKJ - South East (England)

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

To be decided

II.3) Estimated date of publication of contract notice

10 October 2024
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