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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025369-2024 

Not applicable

SOL- Solihull Specialist Smoking Cessation Service
2024

Solihull MBC

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-025369

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04579b  

Published 12 August 2024, 10:21am

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Solihull MBC

The Council House. Manor Square

Solihull

B91 3QB

Contact

Corporate Procurement Service

Email

procteam@solihull.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025369-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025369-2024
mailto:procteam@solihull.gov.uk
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NUTS code

UKG32 - Solihull

Internet address(es)

Main address

www.solihull.gov.uk

Buyer's address

http://www.csw-jets.co.uk/

http://www.solihull.gov.uk
http://www.csw-jets.co.uk/
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

SOL- Solihull Specialist Smoking Cessation Service 2024

Reference number

2024/S 000-021698

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85140000 - Miscellaneous health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Solihull MBC is seeking to procure a Specialist Stop Smoking Service. This tender
opportunity falls under the Health Care Services (Provider Selection Regime) Regulations
2023 (PSR). The contract term is for 5 years from 1st September 2024, with the option to
extend up to 31st August 20231.Estimated maximum total contract value including
extensions - £2,255,750.00, however, the value is subject to changes in grant
funding.Selection includes a minimum turnover threshold, and evaluation will be against
Quality, Price, and Social Value criteria, as per the associated tender documents.

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2024/S 000-021698

/Notice/021698-2024
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Section VII. Changes

VII.1) Information to be changed or added

VII.2) Other additional information

Provider Selection Regime - Following a competition under the competitive process, and the
publication of the Intention to Award Notice (F03 2024/S 000-021698), the standstill
period has now completed with no representations from other suppliers. This Notice is
published as a corrigendum to the Contract Award Notice to confirm the Authority's award of
this contract to ABL Health Ltd (Co. reg. 07074944) .The contract term is for 5 years from
1st September 2024, with the option to extend up to 31st August 2031.Total contract value
and potential extensions is £2,238,250.70.The evaluation was undertaken by: Finance
Manager for Public Health - Resources, Social Value Programme Manager - CPS, Interim
Head of Commissioning – Public Health, PH Contract Manager & Commissioning Support
Officer, Senior Commissioning Manager. Recommendation to award was approved by
Director of Public Health, Education and Inclusion. There were no declared or potential
conflicts of interest, and decision makers were required to complete a Conflict of Interest
Undertaking.
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