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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025358-2023 

Planning

Market Engagement Event for Community Sexual
Health Services

LONDON BOROUGH OF HARINGEY

F01: Prior information notice

Prior information only  

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-025358

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03f7c0  

Published 29 August 2023, 4:06pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

LONDON BOROUGH OF HARINGEY

Alexandra House, 48 Station Road, Wood Green

LONDON

N227TY

Contact

Haringey Council

Email

marlon.roy@haringey.gov.uk

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025358-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025358-2023
mailto:marlon.roy@haringey.gov.uk
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United Kingdom

Region code

UKI - London

Justification for not providing organisation identifier

Not on any register

Internet address(es)

Main address

www.haringey.gov.uk

Buyer's address

https://s2c.waxdigital.co.uk/ProcurementLBHaringey

I.3) Communication

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

General public services

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Market Engagement Event for Community Sexual Health Services

II.1.2) Main CPV code

http://www.haringey.gov.uk
https://s2c.waxdigital.co.uk/ProcurementLBHaringey
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85100000 - Health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Haringey Community Sexual Health Service- Outreach and Health Promotion

Haringey Council is seeking to procure a sexual health & HIV (outreach and promotions)
prevention and community testing service for all of its diverse population, and with particular
focus on the following Haringey residents:

• BME Adult Communities (over 18's) in Haringey. Particular attention will be given to Black
African, Caribbean and Latin American communities 

• BME men who have sex with men (MSM)

• BME LGBT

• Other communities in Haringey who may not be accessing services and support due to
language barriers 

The service will deliver a range of accessible, high-quality, responsive, cost-effective,
confidential, outreach and integrated prevention services to Haringey residents, and shall
collaborate and support the delivery of sexual health services in primary care and other
community settings, in partnership with Haringey Council.

The service will provide direct access to sexual health services, safer sex promotion and
signposting (through both staff and advertising) to other local sexual health services,
including pharmacists and general practice. It is essential that this information is clearly
accessible to users when services close during usual opening times as a result of capacity or
unplanned reasons.

The Provider will deliver a community sexual health service that works closely with all sexual
and reproductive services, GUM, Primary Care (General Practice & Pharmacies), Specialist
HIV clinics, counselling and outpatients and other sexual health services.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £1,750,000
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II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: Yes

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Lot No

1

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

85100000 - Health services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKI - London

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

Haringey Community Sexual Health Service- Outreach and Health Promotion

Haringey Council is seeking to procure a sexual health & HIV (outreach and promotions)
prevention and community testing service for all of its diverse population, and with particular
focus on the following Haringey residents:

• BME Adult Communities (over 18's) in Haringey. Particular attention will be given to Black
African, Caribbean and Latin American communities 

• BME men who have sex with men (MSM)

• BME LGBT

• Other communities in Haringey who may not be accessing services and support due to
language barriers 

The service will deliver a range of accessible, high-quality, responsive, cost-effective,
confidential, outreach and integrated prevention services to Haringey residents, and shall
collaborate and support the delivery of sexual health services in primary care and other
community settings, in partnership with Haringey Council.
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The service will provide direct access to sexual health services, safer sex promotion and
signposting (through both staff and advertising) to other local sexual health services,
including pharmacists and general practice. It is essential that this information is clearly
accessible to users when services close during usual opening times as a result of capacity or
unplanned reasons.

The Provider will deliver a community sexual health service that works closely with all sexual
and reproductive services, GUM, Primary Care (General Practice & Pharmacies), Specialist
HIV clinics, counselling and outpatients and other sexual health services.

II.2.14) Additional information

If you would like to express your interest in attending this event, please click this link: 

http://redirect.transaxions.com/events/kJmVE

Click on "View Details" (button next to event title) and follow the on-screen instructions

Alternatively search for Market Engagement Event - Community Sexual Health Services

You will be required to provide the name of delegate and organisation details, including
address, delegate email address and contact number. Once registered, you will be sent an
invitation to a Microsoft Teams meeting. 

Please note, a separate registration is required for each attendee. Interested organisations
are asked to limit the number of attendees to no more than 2 representatives.

The closing date for registering attendance is 5pm, on 11th September 2023. Please note
that expressions of interest will not be accepted by any means other than through Haringey
Procurement & Contracts System (HPCS).

This is NOT a Contract Notice or an Invitation to tender for the service and the Council
reserves the right to change its approach. A separate notice will be published separately if
the procurement is carried out.

II.3) Estimated date of publication of contract notice

26 September 2023

http://redirect.transaxions.com/events/kJmVE
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No
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