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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025293-2021 

Tender

PTSMHP Training Delivery Evaluation - Final

Health Education England

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-025293
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02ea3a  
Published 11 October 2021, 8:03am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Health Education England

1st Floor, Blenheim House, Duncombe Street

Leeds

LS1 4PL

Contact

Mr Mark Gilbert

Email

Mark.Gilbert@hee.nhs.uk

Telephone

+44 0

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025293-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/025293-2021
mailto:Mark.Gilbert@hee.nhs.uk
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://hee.nhs.uk/

Buyer's address

https://hee.nhs.uk/

I.2) Information about joint procurement

The contract is awarded by a central purchasing body

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-
ec11-810e-005056b64545

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-
ec11-810e-005056b64545

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

https://hee.nhs.uk/
https://hee.nhs.uk/
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-ec11-810e-005056b64545
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-ec11-810e-005056b64545
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-ec11-810e-005056b64545
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert/Index?advertId=e89ee428-5d2a-ec11-810e-005056b64545
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

PTSMHP Training Delivery Evaluation - Final

Reference number

DN575076

II.1.2) Main CPV code

80000000 - Education and training services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

1.1 The PT-SMHP National Curriculum Delivery Evaluation is a detailed national
examination of Health Education England commissioned PT-SMHP training to evaluate
the current training provision available nationally for workforce delivering services across
the identified mental health areas from the following perspectives:

• Training provider

• Trainee

• Sponsoring Manager

• HEE Regional Lead

1.2 The tender is for one year with the option of extend.

1.3 The evaluation will be carried out by an appreciative inquiry methodology identifying
issues associated with training delivery through a quantitative and qualitative analysis.

1.4 Delivery of an evaluation end report with considerations indicating next steps and
implementation risks.

1.5 The overarching aim of this work is to support workforce development to support the
delivery of the LTP Policy ambitions.



Page 4 to 7

1.6 This work is to be conducted with a mixed methodology approach including (but not
limited to) active field studies with the service areas mentioned, desktop research,
academic enquiry, and quantitative data collection.

1.7 The data collection of available learning must include (but is not limited to) please see
APPENDIX 2 within the PT-SMHP Training Delivery Evaluation Specification document.

1.8 Delivery will be expected to take no longer than 3 months to complete with the final
report to be presented April 2022.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

1.1 The PT-SMHP National Curriculum Delivery Evaluation is a detailed national
examination of Health Education England commissioned PT-SMHP training to evaluate
the current training provision available nationally for workforce delivering services across
the identified mental health areas from the following perspectives:

• Training provider

• Trainee

• Sponsoring Manager

• HEE Regional Lead

1.2 The tender is for one year with the option of extend.

1.3 The evaluation will be carried out by an appreciative inquiry methodology identifying
issues associated with training delivery through a quantitative and qualitative analysis.
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1.4 Delivery of an evaluation end report with considerations indicating next steps and
implementation risks.

1.5 The overarching aim of this work is to support workforce development to support the
delivery of the LTP Policy ambitions.

1.6 This work is to be conducted with a mixed methodology approach including (but not
limited to) active field studies with the service areas mentioned, desktop research,
academic enquiry, and quantitative data collection.

1.7 The data collection of available learning must include (but is not limited to) please see
APPENDIX 2 within the PT-SMHP Training Delivery Evaluation Specification document.

1.8 Delivery will be expected to take no longer than 3 months to complete with the final
report to be presented April 2022.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

End date

30 April 2022

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

8 November 2021

Local time

12:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

9 November 2021

Local time

12:05pm
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Health Education England

Blenheim House

Leeds

LS14PL

Email

mark.gilbert@hee.nhs.uk

Country

United Kingdom
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