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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/024716-2022 

Tender

Corby Urgent Care Centre

NHS Northamptonshire ICB

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-024716
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-036590  
Published 2 September 2022, 4:43pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

NHS Northamptonshire ICB

Francis Crick House, Summerhouse Road, Moulton Park Industrial Estate

Northampton

NN3 6BJ

Email

nelcsu.procurementnorthants@nhs.net

Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UKF24 - West Northamptonshire

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/024716-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/024716-2022
mailto:nelcsu.procurementnorthants@nhs.net
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https://www.icnorthamptonshire.org.uk/icb

Buyer's address

https://www.icnorthamptonshire.org.uk/icb

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-
ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-
ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Corby Urgent Care Centre

Reference number

DN604931

II.1.2) Main CPV code

https://www.icnorthamptonshire.org.uk/icb
https://www.icnorthamptonshire.org.uk/icb
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=e45ed27a-022a-ed11-8119-005056b64545&p=ad706dc1-5684-e511-80f3-000c29c9ba21
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85100000 - Health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

NHS Northamptonshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) (the Authority) is seeking to procure
a service for the Corby Urgent Care Centre under NHS Standard Contract arrangements
with the objective to provide timely treatment for less serious illnesses and injuries which
require immediate care but which do not require the full services of an Accident &
Emergency Department. The Service provision is to include minor illness and injury in
adults and children of any age, including wound closure, removal of superficial foreign
bodies and the management of minor head and eye injuries.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £39,000,000

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKF24 - West Northamptonshire

UKF25 - North Northamptonshire

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

NHS Northamptonshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) (the Authority) is seeking to procure
a service for the Corby Urgent Care Centre under NHS Standard Contract arrangements
with the objective to provide timely treatment for less serious illnesses and injuries which
require immediate care but which do not require the full services of an Accident &
Emergency Department. The Service provision is to include minor illness and injury in
adults and children of any age, including wound closure, removal of superficial foreign
bodies and the management of minor head and eye injuries.

Potential bidders will also need to consider an approach to support the following needs;
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• Support a reduction in emergency admissions by working collaboratively with
community-based services.

• Provide a Continuing Care Clinician and wellness hub that meets the needs of the local
population.

• Contribute to reducing ambulance conveyance to A&E.

The service will be based in the purpose-built facility on the Willowbrook site, Cottingham
Road, Corby, Northamptonshire for the duration of the contract. The opening hours will be
8am - 8pm, 365 days a year. The contract will be for a period of 5 years, commencing
April 2023, with an indicative annual value of £7,800,000.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Start date

1 April 2023

End date

31 March 2028

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

4 October 2022

Local time

12:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

4 October 2022

Local time

12:05pm
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Arden & GEM CSU

Leicester

Country

United Kingdom
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