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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/019481-2021 

Not applicable

ASC0255 - Leicester Specialist Substance Misuse
Service

Leicester City Council

Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for Leicestershire

National Probation Service

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-019481

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02d388  

Published 11 August 2021, 2:46pm

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Leicester City Council

City Hall (4th Floor), 115 Charles Street

Leicester

LE1 1FZ

Contact

Ashok Chotalia

Email

procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk

Telephone

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/019481-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/019481-2021
mailto:procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk
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+44 1164542383

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF21 - Leicester

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.leicester.gov.uk

Buyer's address

http://www.leicester.gov.uk

I.1) Name and addresses

Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for Leicestershire

St Johns, Enderby

Leicester

LE19 2BX

Contact

Ashok Chotalia

Email

procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1164542383

Country

http://www.leicester.gov.uk
http://www.leicester.gov.uk
mailto:procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF21 - Leicester

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/About-Us/About-Us.aspx

Buyer's address

http://www.leicester.gov.uk

I.1) Name and addresses

National Probation Service

8 Corporation Street

Lincoln

LN2 1HN

Contact

Ashok Chotalia

Email

procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1164542383

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/About-Us/About-Us.aspx
http://www.leicester.gov.uk
mailto:procurement-asc@leicester.gov.uk
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UKF21 - Leicester

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/national-probation-service

Buyer's address

http://www.leicester.gov.uk

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

ASC0255 - Leicester Specialist Substance Misuse Service

Reference number

ASC0255

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Leicester City Council invites Tenders from suitably qualified and experienced organisations
for the provision of the Specialist Substance Misuse Service (SSMS) to be commissioned by
Leicester City Council for itself and its partners the Office of the Police and Crime
Commissioner and the National Probation Service.

Leicester City Council acts as the lead commissioner and host organisation under a formal
partnership agreement with the above-named organisations. Operating from a range of
locations and venues in Leicester City, the successful provider shall aim to reduce the

https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/national-probation-service
http://www.leicester.gov.uk
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substance related harms to individuals, families and communities whilst helping individuals
to build recovery for themselves and recovery communities to develop and thrive. The
provider is required to deliver a comprehensive range of interventions including but not
limited to open access services, needle exchange, assessment and care coordination,
pharmacy/primary and secondary care liaison and support, clinical and pharmacological
interventions, peer mentoring and volunteer programme and assertive linkage to mutual aid.
In addition, the provider shall work collaboratively with criminal justice agencies to develop a
robust pathway across custody and post release. The provider shall develop and support
access to wraparound services across the city, including but not limited to education,
training and employment, leisure activities and suitable housing.

This service provider will also hold a ringfenced £365,000 budget for residential
rehabilitation placements and must ensure a robust monitoring system is in place that can
track placements and spend as part of its reporting arrangements to Leicester City Council.

Section VII. Changes

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

II.2.4

Place of text to be modified

Description of the procurement

Instead of

Text

The nominal contract value is £4,794,726.00 per annum and £33,563,082.00 for the full 7
year contract period.

Read

Text

The nominal contract value is £4,870,262 for Year One only, £4,794,726.00 per annum for
all the other years and £33,638,618 aggregated for the full 7 year contract period.

Section number
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II.1.5

Place of text to be modified

Estimated total value

Instead of

Text

Value excluding VAT: £33,563,082

Read

Text

Value excluding VAT: £33,638,618

Section number

II.2.6

Place of text to be modified

Estimated value

Instead of

Text

Value excluding VAT: £33,563,082

Read

Text

Value excluding VAT: £33,638,618
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