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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/018262-2021 

Tender

CP2099-21 Open Up To Skills

Devon County Council

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-018262
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02cec4  
Published 30 July 2021, 2:06pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Devon County Council

County Hall, Topsham Road

Exeter

EX2 4QD

Contact

Miss Alice Drury

Email

alice.drury@devon.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1392383000

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/018262-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/018262-2021
mailto:alice.drury@devon.gov.uk
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK43 - Devon CC

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://www.devon.gov.uk

Buyer's address

http://www.devon.gov.uk

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://www.supplyingthesouthwest.org.uk/

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://www.supplyingthesouthwest.org.uk/

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

General public services

http://www.devon.gov.uk
http://www.devon.gov.uk
https://www.supplyingthesouthwest.org.uk/
https://www.supplyingthesouthwest.org.uk/
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

CP2099-21 Open Up To Skills

Reference number

DN554232

II.1.2) Main CPV code

80570000 - Personal development training services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

As part of Devon County Council’s Recovery Response, the ‘Open Up to Skills’ project
will provide a menu of additional training opportunities for those individuals and
companies within the hospitality, catering, leisure, tourism and retail sectors who have
been most adversely affected by the COVID pandemic. Across three geographical areas,
the project will support 700 additional training places through an even split of non-
accredited and accredited training places over an 18-month period (to be completed by
March 2023). The project will also support 300 businesses to upskill their staff or support
redeployment across the County. Successful delivery partners will be encouraged to be
flexible and innovative in their approach, but their client base must be located in the three
key geographical areas.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £400,000

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: Yes

Tenders may be submitted for all lots

II.2) Description
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II.2.1) Title

North Devon

Lot No

1

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

80521000 - Training programme services

80522000 - Training seminars

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKK43 - Devon CC

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

As part of Devon County Council’s Recovery Response, the ‘Open Up to Skills’ project
will provide a menu of additional training opportunities for those individuals and
companies within the hospitality, catering, leisure, tourism and retail sectors who have
been most adversely affected by the COVID pandemic. Across three geographical areas,
the project will support 700 additional training places through an even split of non-
accredited and accredited training places over an 18-month period (to be completed by
March 2023). The project will also support 300 businesses to upskill their staff or support
redeployment across the County. Successful delivery partners will be encouraged to be
flexible and innovative in their approach, but their client base must be located in the three
key geographical areas.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.6) Estimated value

Value excluding VAT: £170,000

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Duration in months
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18

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

South Devon

Lot No

2

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

80521000 - Training programme services

80522000 - Training seminars

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKK43 - Devon CC

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

As part of Devon County Council’s Recovery Response, the ‘Open Up to Skills’ project
will provide a menu of additional training opportunities for those individuals and
companies within the hospitality, catering, leisure, tourism and retail sectors who have
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been most adversely affected by the COVID pandemic. Across three geographical areas,
the project will support 700 additional training places through an even split of non-
accredited and accredited training places over an 18-month period (to be completed by
March 2023). The project will also support 300 businesses to upskill their staff or support
redeployment across the County. Successful delivery partners will be encouraged to be
flexible and innovative in their approach, but their client base must be located in the three
key geographical areas.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.6) Estimated value

Value excluding VAT: £170,000

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Duration in months

18

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Greater Exeter
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Lot No

3

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

80521000 - Training programme services

80522000 - Training seminars

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKK43 - Devon CC

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

As part of Devon County Council’s Recovery Response, the ‘Open Up to Skills’ project
will provide a menu of additional training opportunities for those individuals and
companies within the hospitality, catering, leisure, tourism and retail sectors who have
been most adversely affected by the COVID pandemic. Across three geographical areas,
the project will support 700 additional training places through an even split of non-
accredited and accredited training places over an 18-month period (to be completed by
March 2023). The project will also support 300 businesses to upskill their staff or support
redeployment across the County. Successful delivery partners will be encouraged to be
flexible and innovative in their approach, but their client base must be located in the three
key geographical areas.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.6) Estimated value

Value excluding VAT: £95,000

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Duration in months

18

This contract is subject to renewal
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No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

30 August 2021

Local time

12:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.6) Minimum time frame during which the tenderer must maintain the tender

Duration in months: 1 (from the date stated for receipt of tender)

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

30 August 2021

Local time

3:00pm
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Devon County Council

Devon

Country

United Kingdom
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