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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/017880-2022 

Not applicable

Domestic Abuse Support in Safe Accommodation

Norfolk County Council

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-017880

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-0344c5  

Published 30 June 2022, 1:10pm

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Norfolk County Council

County Hall, Martineau Lane

Norwich

NR1 2DH

Contact

Sarah Hardy

Email

sourcingteam@norfolk.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/017880-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/017880-2022
mailto:sourcingteam@norfolk.gov.uk
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NUTS code

UKH15 - Norwich and East Norfolk

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.norfolk.gov.uk/

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Domestic Abuse Support in Safe Accommodation

Reference number

2022/S 000-015904

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Norfolk County Council wishes to commission a support in safe accommodation service. The
service will provide support in all forms of safe accommodation as defined by the Domestic
Abuse Act 2021. The Council is seeking to purchase services that will form a network of
support in safe accommodation across Norfolk and shall be part of a National network of
safe accommodation which in terms of Norfolk, may mean accepting referrals outside of the
county, and where victim-survivors in Norfolk may need safe accommodation out of the
county to keep them safe.

https://www.norfolk.gov.uk/
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2022/S 000-015904

Section VII. Changes

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

II.2 Description

Lot No

2

Instead of

Text

Norfolk County Council wishes to commission a support in safe accommodation service. The
service will provide support in all forms of safe accommodation as defined by the Domestic
Abuse Act 2021. This lot covers outreach support in dispersed safe accommodation

Read

Text

Norfolk County Council wishes to commission a support in safe accommodation service. The
service will provide support in all forms of safe accommodation as defined by the Domestic
Abuse Act 2021. This lot covers outreach support in dispersed safe accommodation. This lot
also includes outreach community support in other establishments such as schools and
outreach support in the community.

Section number

II.1.4

Instead of

Text

/Notice/015904-2022
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Norfolk County Council wishes to commission a support in safe accommodation service. The
service will provide support in all forms of safe accommodation as defined by the Domestic
Abuse Act 2021. The Council is seeking to purchase services that will form a network of
support in safe accommodation across Norfolk and shall be part of a National network of
safe accommodation which in terms of Norfolk, may mean accepting referrals outside of the
county, and where victim-survivors in Norfolk may need safe accommodation out of the
county to keep them safe.

Read

Text

Norfolk County Council wishes to commission a support in safe accommodation service and
outreach in the community. The service will provide support in all forms of safe
accommodation as defined by the Domestic Abuse Act 2021. The Council is seeking to
purchase services that will form a network of support in safe accommodation across Norfolk
and shall be part of a National network of safe accommodation which in terms of Norfolk,
may mean accepting referrals outside of the county, and where victim-survivors in Norfolk
may need safe accommodation out of the county to keep them safe. As this is a framework
under the Light Touch Regime, the Council has flexibility. The Council reserves the right to re-
open the framework for further suppliers to apply and/or to add additional lots during the life
of the framework.
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