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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/016871-2021 

Tender

Low Carbon Barrow - 'BUGOUT' Design and Build Mobile
Low Carbon Demonstration Vehicle

Barrow-In-Furness Council

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-016871
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02c959  
Published 19 July 2021, 9:44am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Barrow-In-Furness Council

Town Hall

BARROW-IN-FURNESS

LA142LD

Contact

Jamie Muir

Email

jmuir@barrowbc.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1229876410

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/016871-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/016871-2021
mailto:jmuir@barrowbc.gov.uk
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD1 - Cumbria

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.barrowbc.gov.uk/

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-8
10d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-8
10d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

Other activity

Local Authority

https://www.barrowbc.gov.uk/
https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-810d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True
https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-810d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True
https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-810d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True
https://procontract.due-north.com/Procurer/Advert/View?advertId=39b5f462-69e8-eb11-810d-005056b64545&fromAdvertEvent=True
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Low Carbon Barrow - 'BUGOUT' Design and Build Mobile Low Carbon Demonstration
Vehicle

Reference number

DN557161

II.1.2) Main CPV code

50100000 - Repair, maintenance and associated services of vehicles and related equipment

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Art Gene have completed the concept design for a mobile low carbon demonstration
vehicle and trailer which will be capable of touring key sites across the Barrow peninsula
showcasing a range of 'everyday' low carbon technologies which could be adopted within
business and community spaces and supported by the Low Carbon Barrow Grants
Programme where necessary and appropriate.

Bug-Out will help people save carbon in their everyday lives and promote the actions and
advice resulting from the Council's Climate Change Policy and Action Plan. BugOut will
also support the programme of Citizens' Assemblies and public engagement events
planned to support the implementation of the Low Carbon Barrow Programme as well as
support the realisation of benefits from the exemplar demonstration projects.

Art Gene will procure (in accordance with the Council's Contract Standing Orders) a
specialist fabricator to work with them on the construction of BugOut. Art Gene directors
(Maddi Nicholson and Stuart Bastik will support the appointed fabricators on the detailed
specification and final design).

Art Gene will appoint a Environmental Engagement Manager to accompany BugOut and
support the development of a community outreach programme taking BugOut to
community events including community sports events, schools and highly trafficked areas
of the town centres and civic spaces. BugOut may also link up with the Low Carbon Lake
District ESIF programme and go 'on tour' across Cumbria.
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II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKD1 - Cumbria

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

About Low Carbon Barrow:

Low Carbon Barrow is a £2m programme of investment in a range of low carbon projects
across Barrow-in-Furness funded by the UK European Structural and Investment Fund
and the Cumbria LEP. The project is a partnership between Barrow Borough Council and
Art Gene, with Barrow Borough Council facilitating the tender process for this contract and
Art Gene being the Awarding/Contracting body.

About Art Gene:

Art Gene is an established and respected artist led, arts charity, a unique, independent,
international research facility founded and driven by artists Stuart Bastik and Maddi
Nicholson, and based in Barrow-in-Furness, Cumbria. https://www.art-gene.co.uk/

Art Gene has established an international programme of residencies and exhibitions,
adapting to and learning from collaborative working of highly skilled associates including
artists, architects, curators ecologists and other environmental specialists from all over the
world. These associates contribute to our research through studio-based residencies,
fellowships, charrettes, think tanks, seminars and exhibitions in the Art Gene Gallery, and
partner with us to develop and realise a wide portfolio of projects in and around Barrow,
Walney and further afield.

Art Gene places a strong emphasis on research, undertaking a range of pure research
activities which inform and are applied to the development and realisation of projects.

We work with the local community, alongside multidisciplinary teams of architects, artists
and other specialists to realise our aim of Re-Visioning the regeneration of the social,
natural and built environment.

Art Gene is arts-led delivering social, natural and built 'engaged value' with local people
and stakeholder organisations. The work is focussed on the environment, values,

https://www.art-gene.co.uk/
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opportunities and communities of the Barrow Borough. The nature of this work is fluid,
dynamic and responsive.

We work locally with communities and the artist directors engage strategically with Local
Authorities, Local Enterprise Partnerships, multi-partner agencies, and sub-regional
economic development partnerships across the county and the North West.

About Bug Out:

Art Gene have completed the concept design for a mobile low carbon demonstration
vehicle and trailer which will be capable of touring key sites across the Barrow peninsula
showcasing a range of 'everyday' low carbon technologies which could be adopted within
business and community spaces and supported by the Low Carbon Barrow Grants
Programme where necessary and appropriate.

Bug-Out will help people save carbon in their everyday lives and promote the actions and
advice resulting from the Council's Climate Change Policy and Action Plan. BugOut will
also support the programme of Citizens' Assemblies and public engagement events
planned to support the implementation of the Low Carbon Barrow Programme as well as
support the realisation of benefits from the exemplar demonstration projects.

Art Gene will procure (in accordance with the Council's Contract Standing Orders) a
specialist fabricator to work with them on the construction of BugOut. Art Gene directors
(Maddi Nicholson and Stuart Bastik will support the appointed fabricators on the detailed
specification and final design).

Art Gene will appoint a Environmental Engagement Manager to accompany BugOut and
support the development of a community outreach programme taking BugOut to
community events including community sports events, schools and highly trafficked areas
of the town centres and civic spaces. BugOut may also link up with the Low Carbon Lake
District ESIF programme and go 'on tour' across Cumbria.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Technical Capability / Weighting: 75%

Quality criterion - Name: Social Value / Weighting: 5%

Price - Weighting: 25% 

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

Start date
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1 October 2021

End date

29 April 2022

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: Yes

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

13 August 2021

Local time

5:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.6) Minimum time frame during which the tenderer must maintain the tender

Tender must be valid until: 25 October 2021

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

20 August 2021

Local time

11:00am
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Barrow Borough Council

Barrow-in-Furness

Country

United Kingdom
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