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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/015060-2023 

Tender

PRJ 1227 NHS SEL Wheelchair Services - All Age
(Greenwich)

NHS South East London Integrated Care Board

F01: Prior information notice

Call for competition  

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-015060

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03cfbc  

Published 26 May 2023, 11:21am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

NHS South East London Integrated Care Board

160 Tooley Street

London

SE1 2TZ

Contact

Mr Odezi Stephen Ivuerah

Email

odezistephen.ivuerah@nhs.net

Telephone

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/015060-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/015060-2023
mailto:odezistephen.ivuerah@nhs.net
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+44 7769276947

Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UKI - London

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.selondonics.org/icb/

Buyer's address

https://www.selondonics.org/icb/

I.2) Information about joint procurement

The contract is awarded by a central purchasing body

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://procontract.due-north.com

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://procontract.due-north.com

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

https://www.selondonics.org/icb/
https://www.selondonics.org/icb/
https://procontract.due-north.com
https://procontract.due-north.com
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Health

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

PRJ 1227 NHS SEL Wheelchair Services - All Age (Greenwich)

Reference number

DN 669911

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85100000 - Health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

NHS South East London ICB is seeking expression of interest (EOIs) from capable, qualified
and interested providers to provide an all-age wheelchair service which includes local clinics,
wheelchair clinical assessment, clinical review, equipment supply, delivery & collection;
personal wheelchair budget options; repair and maintenance of NHS wheelchairs;
emergency/urgent response.

The service provides a stock of Mobility Equipment (and manages the ongoing maintenance
of equipment on that List) to support residents in achieving the best possible independence
in their day-to-day living. The stock of Mobility Equipment includes postural seating, seating
cushions and further flexibility in the client’s preferences for their wheelchair. This is referred
to as Personal Wheelchair Budgets-PWBs- or (interchangeably), Personal Health Budgets-
PHBs. The total activity, which includes clinical assessment and review, provision of
equipment, spare parts, collection and scrapping of equipment, is universally referred to as
the “Wheelchair Service”.

The contract will be offered for a period of three years 13 months, with an option to extend
for
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an additional 24 months (3 years and 1 month in total) at the Authority’s sole discretion.

Contract value for the initial 3 years will be £2,100,000, (Annual contract value £700,000).

The deadline for expression of interest is 12:00 (noon) on 16 June 2023. Any expressions of
interest received after this deadline will not be considered.

Interested organisation must express an interest via Pro-contract e-tendering portal. Bidders

needs to register on Pro-contract if they are not registered already. This can be done by

clicking the below link.

https://procontract.due-north.com/Register

Once registered, you can express an interest in this project and submit the EOI form by

clicking the following link to this specific project:

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-
ed11-8122-005056b64545

Please note that any expressions of interests by any other means will not be considered.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKI - London

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

NHS London Commercial Hub, Hosted by NEL ICB is managing this process on behalf of

NHS South East London ICB (The Authority). The LCH is conducting this EoI exercise as
agent for and on behalf of the principal(s) (being the Authority) with whom the successful
Applicant will ultimately enter contracts for the supply of the Service(s).

https://procontract.due-north.com/Register
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-ed11-8122-005056b64545
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-ed11-8122-005056b64545
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Interested providers (Applicants) are requested to register their organisation, and express
their interest in the EOI via the e-tendering portal (ProContract). EOI documentation can be
accessed following expression of interest via the e-tendering portal:

https://proContract.due-north.com/register

The EOI has been issued through the e-tendering portal. All Applicants wishing to participate
must complete and submit EOIs. Applicants are required to complete the attached EOI
Questionnaire on the e-tendering portal and submit it before the Deadline for submission of
EOIs.

https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-
ed11-8122-005056b64545

Please note that the contract(s) will be awarded without further publication. Interested

organisations must express their interest as instructed in this PIN notice if they wish to take

part in this procurement process.

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing
system

This contract is subject to renewal

Yes

Description of renewals

The contract will be offered for a period of 13 months, with an option to extend for

an additional 24 months (3 years and 1 month in total) at the Authority’s sole discretion.

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

https://proContract.due-north.com/register
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-ed11-8122-005056b64545
https://procontract.due-north.com/Advert?advertId=1db4085a-eefa-ed11-8122-005056b64545
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Restricted procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of expressions of interest

Date

16 June 2023

Local time

12:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

NHS London Commercial Hub

5 Station Street

London

E15 1DA

Email

odezistephen.ivuerah@nhs.net

Telephone

+44 7769276947

Country

United Kingdom
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