
Page 1 to 6

  

This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/014316-2024 

Contract

WP3814 - Security Services

Walsall Metropolitan Borough Council

F03: Contract award notice

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-014316
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-041669  
Published 3 May 2024, 11:14am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Walsall Metropolitan Borough Council

Civic Centre, Darwall Street,

Walsall

WS1 1TP

Contact

Julie Jones

Email

procurement@walsall.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/014316-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/014316-2024
mailto:procurement@walsall.gov.uk
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UKG38 - Walsall

Internet address(es)

Main address

www.walsall.gov.uk

Buyer's address

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/walsallcouncil

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

General public services

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

WP3814 - Security Services

Reference number

WP3814

II.1.2) Main CPV code

79710000 - Security services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The Council wishes to procure the services of a suitably qualified and experienced
provider to deliver Walsall Council’s operational security services to Council owned

http://www.walsall.gov.uk
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/walsallcouncil
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buildings and events under their control within the borough. The Council wishes to appoint
one provider for the service outlined in the technical specification in these documents
(Specification, at Part 03, Section A). These services shall be required to cover 24
hours/365-day period (for the benefit of any doubt, to include bank holidays).In relation to
the Key Holding section (Sub Section 2) of the specification. The Council currently has 26
sites where key holding services are in place, however the Council is looking to increase
this number. A list of these properties can be found at Schedule 2 of the
specification.These services will be required to a range of Council owned and managed
buildings (the ‘Council Premises’), a list of these properties has been issued (Appendix 3
– Master Address List) as part of

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.1.7) Total value of the procurement (excluding VAT)

Value excluding VAT: £651,935

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

79710000 - Security services

79711000 - Alarm-monitoring services

79713000 - Guard services

79715000 - Patrol services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKG38 - Walsall

Main site or place of performance

Walsall

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The Council wishes to appoint one provider for the service outlined in the technical
specification in these documents (Specification, at Part 03, Section A). These services
shall be required to cover 24 hours/365-day period (for the benefit of any doubt, to include
bank holidays). In relation to the Key Holding section (Sub Section 2) of the specification.
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The Council currently has 26 sites where key holding services are in place, however the
Council is looking to increase this number. A list of these properties can be found at
Schedule 2 of the specification. These services will be required to a range of Council
owned and managed buildings (the ‘Council Premises’); a list of these properties has
been issued (Appendix 4 – Master Address List) as part of these ITT documents. The
Council reserves the right to add or remove properties to this list as changes to the
property portfolio occurs during the life of the contract. 

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Non-price Criteria / Weighting: 30

Cost criterion - Name: Price / Weighting: 70

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2023/S 000-032918

/Notice/032918-2023
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Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

WC3814

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

3 May 2024

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 23 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 22 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 23 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

MSG Security Limited

73, Sutton Road, Walsall, WS1 2PQ

Walsall

WS1 2PQ

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKG38 - Walsall

National registration number

02784132

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Initial estimated total value of the contract/lot: £290,000

Total value of the contract/lot: £651,935

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

See VI.4.3

Walsall

Country

United Kingdom

VI.4.2) Body responsible for mediation procedures

See VI.4.3

Walsall

Country

United Kingdom
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