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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013770-2025 

Tender

 Holford Drive, Perry Barr Highway Infrastructure Works

Birmingham City Council

UK4: Tender notice - Procurement Act 2023 - view information about notice types 

Notice identifier: 2025/S 000-013770
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04ff1c (view related notices)
Published 8 April 2025, 4:31pm

Scope 

Reference

P1310

Description

Birmingham City Council (the Council) is seeking for organisations for the Holford Drive,
Perry Barr highway infrastructure works.

The proposed works include improvements along Holford Drive to provide additional road
space to provide right/left turn lanes at Aldridge Road traffic signal junction, right turn lane
into the new high school and footway pedestrian space on both sides of the highway.
Limit waiting along the highway to prevent traffic restrictions to the newly provided traffic
lanes.

The scope of the works includes:

• Improvements to Holford Drive to provide an additional traffic lane on the approach to
Aldridge Road by widening into the former Midland Chrome Plating site and widening of
the existing carriageway on the approach to the Holford Household Recycling Centre.

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013770-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013770-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Home/NoticeTypes
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/procurement/ocds-h6vhtk-04ff1c
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• Conversion of the Holford Drive arm traffic signals to allow a Toucan crossing in the
future for a proposed cycle route on Aldridge Road.

• Resurfacing of the carriageway over the scheme extents to the new highway alignment.

• Alterations and provision of new drainage for the new highway alignment.

• Construction of a new 3m wide footway on the southern side of Holford Drive from
Aldridge Road to the school.

• Removal and replacement of the existing fence and wall forming the boundary to the
former Midland Chrome Plating site for the new highway alignment.

• Accommodation works to the school access, temporary car park access of the formally
Midland Chrome Plating site, Allotments, and private drives for the new highway
alignment.

• Removal of the existing Zebra crossing outside the school.

• Construction of a new footway on the southern side of Holford Drive from the school to
the link to the existing footway outside the West Midland Police Custody Suite.

• Regrading of the existing embankment to facilitate the above including provision of
retaining structure if required.

• Alterations and provision of new street lighting for the new highway alignment.

• Relining of the carriageway for the new highway layout including Aldridge Road.

• Install additional traffic signal equipment on Southbound arm of Aldridge Road and
Holford Drive.

• Tie-in works to the new access for the recycling centre.

• Restrict parking along Holford Drive.

• Protection/diversion of services to facilitate the above

The contract will be awarded to one supplier.

The Council will be using its free to use e-tendering system (in-tend) for the administration
of this procurement process and potential suppliers must register with the system to be
able to express an interest. If you wish to express an interest in this opportunity please
click on the following link to access https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc/ and submit

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc/
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your details to register.

You will then be able to log on which will enable you to download all relevant quotation
documentation. If you are unable to register with In-tend or have any questions or
problems on how to use this web site please either email us at: 
etendering@birmingham.gov.uk.

Your completed quotation submission should be returned by 5pm on 29th April 2025 via
the 'in-tend' system https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc

Total value (estimated)

£1,400,000 excluding VAT

£1,680,000 including VAT

Below the relevant threshold

Contract dates (estimated)

30 June 2025 to 1 February 2026

7 months, 2 days

Main procurement category

Works

CPV classifications

45233100 - Construction work for highways, roads

45233130 - Construction work for highways

71311210 - Highways consultancy services

mailto:etendering@birmingham.gov.uk
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc
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Contract locations

UKG31 - Birmingham

Submission 

Enquiry deadline

23 April 2025, 1:00am

Tender submission deadline

29 April 2025, 6:00pm

Submission address and any special instructions

The Council will be using its free to use e-tendering system (in-tend) for the administration
of this procurement process and potential suppliers must register with the system to be
able to express an interest. If you wish to express an interest in this opportunity please
click on the following link to access https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc/ and submit
your details to register.

You will then be able to log on which will enable you to download all relevant quotation
documentation. If you are unable to register with In-tend or have any questions or
problems on how to use this web site please either email us at: 
etendering@birmingham.gov.uk.

Your completed quotation submission should be returned by 5pm on 29th April 2025 via
the 'in-tend' system https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc/
mailto:etendering@birmingham.gov.uk
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc
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Tenders may be submitted electronically

Yes

Procedure 

Procedure type

Below threshold - open competition

Contracting authority 

Birmingham City Council

Public Procurement Organisation Number: PCJJ-4826-QMLZ

Council House, 1 Victoria Square

Birmingham

B1 1BB

United Kingdom

Contact name: Commercial and Procurement Services

Email: etendering@birmingham.gov.uk

Website: http://www.in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc

Region: UKG31 - Birmingham

mailto:etendering@birmingham.gov.uk
http://www.in-tendhost.co.uk/birminghamcc
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Organisation type: Public authority - sub-central government
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