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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013681-2024 

Not applicable

EPP0103 Provision of kerbside household waste and
recycling collection and street sweeping, litter
collection and beach cleaning services contract(s)

Essex County Council

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-013681

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04489e  

Published 29 April 2024, 8:34am

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Essex County Council

County Hall, Market Road

Chelmsford

CM1 1QH

Contact

Miss Bethany Gray

Email

Bethany.gray@essex.gov.uk

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013681-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/013681-2024
mailto:Bethany.gray@essex.gov.uk
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United Kingdom

Region code

UKH3 - Essex

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.essex.gov.uk/

Buyer's address

https://www.essex.gov.uk/

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

EPP0103 Provision of kerbside household waste and recycling collection and street
sweeping, litter collection and beach cleaning services contract(s)

Reference number

DN711618

II.1.2) Main CPV code

90610000 - Street-cleaning and sweeping services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Following the responses received to the Council's market engagement questionnaire, the
Council wishes to invite interested providers to attend 1-2-1 market engagement sessions –
either in person within Essex (location to be confirmed upon booking) or online via a Teams

https://www.essex.gov.uk/
https://www.essex.gov.uk/
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meeting to further discuss their responses to the Council's market engagement
questionnaire.

A timetable of available sessions has been provided below for providers to select from. These
will be allocated on a first-come first-served basis. The Council intends for these 1-2-1
sessions to be up to two hours in length.

To book a 1-2-1 session please email wasteservice.procurement@essex.gov.uk

Providers can choose whether the below meetings are conducted face to face within Essex
(location to be confirmed upon booking) or virtually via Teams.

8th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

8th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

16th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

16th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

Timetable for virtual Meetings via Teams Only:

7th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

14th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

17th May 2024 - 1pm - 3pm

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2024/S 000-008199

mailto:wasteservice.procurement@essex.gov.uk
/Notice/008199-2024
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Section VII. Changes

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

II.2.4

Place of text to be modified

II.2.4

Instead of

Text

Tendring District Council currently has a seven plus seven year contract in place for the
provision of kerbside household waste and recycling collection and street sweeping services
contracts. The Street sweeping services contract, which includes the servicing of street litter
and dog waste bins plus the cleaning of seafront and beach locations in the district is set to
expire on the 31st December 2025. Whilst the kerbside household waste and recycling
contract which currently collects waste and recycling from over 74,000 households in the
district is set to expire on 31st January 2026, hence the Council are seeking to procure new
arrangements.

The Council’s primary concerns/objectives are price, compliance with the Environmental Act
2021, simpler recycling requirements and the impacts of the Extended Producer
Responsibility and Deposit Return Scheme, and how we can minimise our exposure to these
concerns.

The Council wishes to invite interested providers to complete the market engagement
questionnaire which can be found at the link below; the closing date for this questionnaire is
28th March 2024

https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=TzK0qFwVFUKg8X7YzJqZL1quwy3
cwqRCpHE9mZybFrdUNFlTVTQ3TVoyVlVaNEc2NElMWTNaUTZJQi4u

It is important to note that this PIN is not a call for competition and as such you will need to
express your interest in any future tender opportunity once the contract notice is published
in Find a Tender and on Contracts Finder.

It should also be noted that this PIN invites individuals and organisations to express an
interest in this exercise only, and it is NOT a pre-qualification questionnaire, and is NOT part
of any pre-qualification or selection process.

https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=TzK0qFwVFUKg8X7YzJqZL1quwy3cwqRCpHE9mZybFrdUNFlTVTQ3TVoyVlVaNEc2NElMWTNaUTZJQi4u
https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=TzK0qFwVFUKg8X7YzJqZL1quwy3cwqRCpHE9mZybFrdUNFlTVTQ3TVoyVlVaNEc2NElMWTNaUTZJQi4u
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This PIN is intended as an awareness, communication, and information gathering exercise.
An expression of interest is no indication of a commitment to participate in any future
tendering process nor does it infer any preferential or special status on those individuals and
organisations who participate.

No decision has been taken at this stage with regards to the type of procedure, contract
length along with any potential extension periods or the use of lots.

Read

Text

Tendring District Council currently has a seven plus seven year contract in place for the
provision of kerbside household waste and recycling collection and street sweeping services
contracts. The Street sweeping services contract, which includes the servicing of street litter
and dog waste bins plus the cleaning of seafront and beach locations in the district is set to
expire on the 31st December 2025. Whilst the kerbside household waste and recycling
contract which currently collects waste and recycling from over 74,000 households in the
district is set to expire on 31st January 2026, hence the Council are seeking to procure new
arrangements.

The Council’s primary concerns/objectives are price, compliance with the Environmental Act
2021, simpler recycling requirements and the impacts of the Extended Producer
Responsibility and Deposit Return Scheme, and how we can minimise our exposure to these
concerns.

Following the responses received to the Council's market engagement questionnaire, the
Council wishes to invite interested providers to attend 1-2-1 market engagement sessions –
either in person within Essex (location to be confirmed upon booking) or online via a Teams
meeting to further discuss their responses to the Council's market engagement
questionnaire.

A timetable of available sessions has been provided below for providers to select from. These
will be allocated on a first-come first-served basis. The Council intends for these 1-2-1
sessions to be up to two hours in length.

To book a 1-2-1 session please email wasteservice.procurement@essex.gov.uk

Providers can choose whether the below meetings are conducted face to face within Essex
(location to be confirmed upon booking) or virtually via Teams.

8th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

8th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

mailto:wasteservice.procurement@essex.gov.uk
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16th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

16th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

Timetable for Virtual Meetings via Teams Only:

7th May 2024 - 10am - 12pm

14th May 2024 - 2pm - 4pm

17th May 2024 - 1pm - 3pm

It is important to note that this PIN is not a call for competition and as such you will need to
express your interest in any future tender opportunity once the contract notice is published
in Find a Tender and on Contracts Finder.

It should also be noted that this PIN invites individuals and organisations to express an
interest in this exercise only and is NOT part of any pre-qualification or selection process.

This PIN is intended as an awareness, communication, and information gathering exercise.
An expression of interest is no indication of a commitment to participate in any future
tendering process nor does it infer any preferential or special status on those individuals and
organisations who participate.
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