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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011709-2024 

Not applicable

NHS Health Checks Community Provision

Norfolk County Council

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-011709
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-0435ac  
Published 11 April 2024, 8:57am

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Norfolk County Council

County Hall, Martineau Lane

Norwich

NR1 1DH

Email

sourcingteam@norfolk.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH15 - Norwich and East Norfolk

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011709-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011709-2024
mailto:sourcingteam@norfolk.gov.uk
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www.norfolk.gov.uk

Buyer's address

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/norfolkcc/aspx/Home

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

NHS Health Checks Community Provision

Reference number

2024/S 000-011698

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85000000 - Health and social work services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Norfolk County Council's Public Health team are seeking to procure a suitable Provider to
deliver a Norfolk wide NHS Health Check (NHS HC) community provision service. The
service will comprise the following key elements: • Flexible and accessible community-
based provision delivered by trained practitioners as per the NHS HC Competency
Framework.• Minimum target delivery of 22,700 NHS Health Checks.• A focus on
engaging innovatively with communities across Norfolk, as well as to targeted groups
where there are higher levels of deprivation and health inequalities.• Working closely with
GP practices across Norfolk to provide capacity support, raise awareness of NHS HCs
and encourage NHS HC invitations. • Providing support with the expected roll-out of the
NHS Digital Health Check in 2024This procurement will be under the Health Care
Services (Provider Selection Regime) Regulations 2023 - Competitive Process.

http://www.norfolk.gov.uk
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/norfolkcc/aspx/Home
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2024/S 000-011698

Section VII. Changes

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

VI.4.3) 

Instead of

Text

The Public Contracts Regulations 2015 (as amended) provide for aggrieved parties who
have been harmed or are at risk of harm by a breach of the rules to take action in the High
Court (England, Wales and Northern Ireland). Proceedings must be brought within 30
days from the date of knowledge (the date on which the economic operator first knew or
ought to have known that grounds for starting the proceedings had arisen) unless the
Court considers that there is good reason for extending the period within which
proceedings maybe brought, in which case the Court may extend that period up to a
maximum of 3 months from the date of knowledge.

Read

Text

A standstill period will follow the council's provisional decision to select a provider and
must end before the contract can be awarded. It gives time for any provider who might
otherwise have been a provider of the services to which the contract relates to make
representations; and for the council to consider those representations and respond as
appropriate. If following the council's review of its representations a provider wishes to
request that the Independent Patient Choice and Procurement Panel considers its
representations, then it must submit its request using a pro forma published by the panel
within 5 working days of receiving the council's decision.
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