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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011177-2022 

Not applicable

Invitation to Tender (ITT) For Social Mobility 'State of
The Nation' 2023

Social Mobility Commission

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-011177

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03296b  

Published 29 April 2022, 2:42pm

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Social Mobility Commission

Sanctuary Building

London

SW1P3BT

Contact

Colin Seymour

Email

Colin.Seymour@cabinetoffice.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011177-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/011177-2022
mailto:Colin.Seymour@cabinetoffice.gov.uk
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Region code

UKI32 - Westminster

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/social-mobility-commission

https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/social-mobility-commission
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Invitation to Tender (ITT) For Social Mobility 'State of The Nation' 2023

Reference number

SMC-2223-36

II.1.2) Main CPV code

79315000 - Social research services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The Social Mobility Commission (SMC) monitors progress towards improving social mobility
in the UK and promotes social mobility in England. It is an independent statutory body
created by an Act of Parliament. 

As part of its remit, the Commission undertakes an annual State of the Nation report. This
report is part of the Commission's statutory duty to monitor UK-wide progress on social
mobility each year. The production and synthesis of key statistics related to social mobility
will be the central part for the report, which will be published by 31 March 2023, in order to
examine, for example, social mobility 'hot' and 'cold' spots in the UK, and break down social
mobility by protected characteristics. 

For 2023, the SMC will, for the first time, fully operationalise its new Social Mobility Index: a
refreshed measurement framework (the SMI). The new framework completely revises the
previous social mobility index, which ran from 2016 to 2017. 

The new and improved SMI offers a much more accurate and robust framework to measure
social mobility. It includes four main components: drivers (or enablers), intermediate
outcomes (such as educational attainment) and their relationship to socio-economic
background; the overlap between socio-economic background and characteristics such as
sex, ethnicity, disability and place; and eventual social mobility outcomes with respect to
occupation, income, education, housing and wealth. 
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The 2023 report will therefore have some similarities to the 2017 and 2022 State of the
Nation Reports. It will build on the work of these reports to analyse the social and economic
drivers and indicators of people's social mobility. As the old index did, we envision this
updated one to also assess how social mobility outcomes compare in national, regional and
local geographic places. We focus on measuring the extent to which rates of social mobility
are improving over time in the UK and across the different parts of the UK, and which specific
groups in society have greater or lesser chances of social mobility.

The SMC is looking for a supplier who can provide robust analyses both from cross-sectional
and longitudinal perspectives, and interpret these statistics to give a clear narrative about
what they mean for social mobility. The SMC is seeking a supplier who can work with the
secretariat to provide analytical and statistical outputs and provide clear instruction for how
the team can conduct the same analyses in future. Replicable analytical procedures form a
key component of what we require to ensure the team gains analytical independence to
conduct the same analyses in future. The SMC also expects a supplier to bring a high level of
quality assurance to the work, arranging for independent analytical checks throughout the
project. 

Additionally, having the ability to interpret and support the SMC to provide a narrative
around these findings is vital, particularly in light of the wide-ranging impacts of Covid-19 on
social mobility. The SMC will therefore be assessing bids both for evidence of being able to
deliver the analytical work and interpreting the findings in a wider social mobility context.

Please see the Jaggaer e-procurement portal. 
https://crowncommercialservice.bravosolution.co.uk/web/login.html

 for the Invitation to Tender (ITT) document and further details.

Bidders must submit their Bids before 12 Noon on 2 May 2022. All Bids must be submitted
through the Jaggaer e-procurement portal. 
https://crowncommercialservice.bravosolution.co.uk/web/login.html

Failure to return Bids by the time and due date or in the required format may disqualify
Bidders from consideration.

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2022/S 000-008912

https://crowncommercialservice.bravosolution.co.uk/web/login.html
https://crowncommercialservice.bravosolution.co.uk/web/login.html
/Notice/008912-2022
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Section VII. Changes

VII.1) Information to be changed or added

VII.2) Other additional information

The Social Mobility Commission was advised by Crown Commercial Services (CCS) that
there are some problems with using the Jaggaer e-tendering portal for this open
procurement. 

The Bid deadline date has been extended. Bidders must now submit their Bids before 12
Noon on 16 May 2022. All Bids must be submitted to 
contact@socialmobilitycommission.gov.uk. Failure to return Bids by the time and due date
or in the required format may disqualify Bidders from consideration.

The contract end date has been extended to 20 June 2023.

Hence, please see the revised invitation to tender (ITT) (with amended 'Indicative
procurement timetable') and responses to clarification questions on Contracts Finder: 
https://www.contractsfinder.service.gov.uk/Notice/3b74e861-f2ac-482f-
b6f8-8ffe21a1355b.

For future correspondence in relation to this tendering exercise, we'd be grateful if you could
please use the shared inbox: contact@socialmobilitycommission.gov.uk
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