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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010405-2023 

Not applicable

Purchase of Counter Uncrewed Air Systems

Ministry of Defence

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-010405
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03bc4d  
Published 11 April 2023, 6:22pm

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Ministry of Defence

Portsmouth

Email

Lauren.Terry103@mod.gov.uk

Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UK - United Kingdom

Internet address(es)

Main address

www.gov.uk

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010405-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010405-2023
mailto:Lauren.Terry103@mod.gov.uk
http://www.gov.uk
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Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Purchase of Counter Uncrewed Air Systems

Reference number

707491452

II.1.2) Main CPV code

35730000 - Electronic warfare systems and counter measures

II.1.3) Type of contract

Supplies

II.1.4) Short description

This Corrigendum Notice is to correct a wording error on VEAT Notice 2023/S
000-009750 - Purchase of Counter Uncrewed Air Systems issued 04/04/2023 and
replaced earlier Corrigendum Notice 2023/S 000-009754 issued 04/04/2023.

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2023/S 000-009750

Section VII. Changes

VII.1) Information to be changed or added

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

Annex D3

Place of text to be modified

/Notice/009750-2023
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1.Justification for the choice of the negotiated procedure without publication of a call for
competition in accordance with Article 28 of Directive 2009/81/EC

Instead of

Text

The products involved are manufactured purely for the purpose of research, experiment,
study or development

Purchase of supplies or services on particularly advantageous terms: from a supplier
which is definitively winding up its business activities

Read

Text

No suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure

Section number

II.1.4

Place of text to be modified

Short Description

Instead of

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Technology LTD for the provision of Counter
Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System threats. The
duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of £1M. In
accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU Exit)
Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Technology Limited on the
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basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

Read

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Aerospace Limited for the provision of
Counter Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System
threats. The duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of
£1M. In accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU
Exit) Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Aerospace Limited on the
basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

Section number

II.2.1

Place of text to be modified

Description of the Procurement

Instead of

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Technology LTD for the provision of Counter
Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System threats. The
duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of £1M. In
accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU Exit)
Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
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legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Technology Limited on the
basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

Read

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Aerospace Limited for the provision of
Counter Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System
threats. The duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of
£1M. In accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU
Exit) Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Aerospace Limited on the
basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

Section number

IV.1.1

Place of text to be modified

Explanation

Instead of

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Technology LTD for the provision of Counter
Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System threats. The
duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of £1M. In
accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU Exit)
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Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Technology Limited on the
basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

Read

Text

The Navy Command Above Water Battlespace team, part of the UK Ministry of Defence
intends to enter into a contract with LiveLink Aerospace Limited for the provision of
Counter Uncrewed Air Systems to address the need to identify Uncrewed Air System
threats. The duration of the contract will be 24 months and has an estimated value of
£1M. In accordance with the provisions of The Public Procurement (Amendment etc.) (EU
Exit) Regulations 2020 SI No. 2020/1319, this procurement falls to be regulated under the
provisions of the Public Contracts Regulations 2015 as amended (in particular by SI
2020/1319). Prior publication of a contract notice in the Official Journal of the European
Union is no longer appropriate. It is considered that the award of the contract without prior
publication of a contract notice in the UK e-notification service (as required by the relevant
legislation) is lawful in accordance with regulation 32(2)(a) of the PCR 2015 because no
suitable tenders have been submitted in response to an open procedure Tender
Reference: 704402452. As no suitable tenders have been submitted in response to
Tender Reference: 704402452, the Authority will use the negotiated procedure without
prior publication of a contract notice to negotiate with LiveLink Aerospace Limited on the
basis that the initial conditions of contract are not substantially altered.

VII.2) Other additional information

This Corrigendum Notice is to correct a wording error on VEAT Notice 2023/S
000-009750 - Purchase of Counter Uncrewed Air Systems issued 04/04/2023 and
replaced earlier Corrigendum Notice 2023/S 000-009754 issued 04/04/2023.
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