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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010160-2022 

Not applicable

Virtual Teaching Platform

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

F14: Notice for changes or additional information

Notice identifier: 2022/S 000-010160
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-032c9a  
Published 19 April 2022, 8:48am

Section I: Contracting authority/entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Royal Hallamshire Hospital, Glossop Road

Sheffield

S10 2JF

Contact

Matthew Clements

Email

matthew.clements3@nhs.net

Country

United Kingdom

Region code

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010160-2022
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/010160-2022
mailto:matthew.clements3@nhs.net
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UKE32 - Sheffield

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.sth.nhs.uk

Buyer's address

https://www.sth.nhs.uk

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Virtual Teaching Platform

Reference number

STH6074/IMT

II.1.2) Main CPV code

72260000 - Software-related services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals are looking at providing a solution that would support virtual
teaching for both clinical and non-clinical staff and would like to understand more about
the market and the systems that are available. This is a scoping activity only and is not
currently a competitive exercise. Please respond to the PIN on Atamis (via attachment in
the requirements section) if you believe your system can meet the requirements listed in
the document section.If you are a supplier who wishes to register please visit 
https://health-family.force.com/s/WelcomeIf you encounter any difficulties whilst using the
portal you can contact the Support Team on 029 2279 0052 or by emailing support-
health@atamis.co.uk

https://www.sth.nhs.uk
https://www.sth.nhs.uk
https://health-family.force.com/s/WelcomeIf
mailto:support-health@atamis.co.uk
mailto:support-health@atamis.co.uk
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.6) Original notice reference

Notice number: 2022/S 000-009725

Section VII. Changes

VII.1.2) Text to be corrected in the original notice

Section number

II.1.4.1

Place of text to be modified

Short description

Instead of

Text

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals are looking at providing a solution that would support virtual
teaching for both clinical and non-clinical staff and would like to understand more about
the market and the systems that are available. This is a scoping activity only and is not
currently a competitive exercise. Please respond to the PIN on Atamis (via attachment in
the requirements section) if you believe your system can meet the requirements listed in
the document section.

If you are a supplier who wishes to register please visit https://health-
family.force.com/s/Welcome

If you encounter any difficulties whilst using the portal you can contact the Support Team
on 029 2279 0052 or by emailing support-health@atamis.co.uk

Read

Text

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals are looking at providing a solution that would support virtual
teaching for both clinical and non-clinical staff and would like to understand more about
the market and the systems that are available. This is a scoping activity only and is not
currently a competitive exercise. Please respond to the PIN on Atamis (via attachment in
the requirements section) if you believe your system can meet the requirements listed in

/Notice/009725-2022
https://health-family.force.com/s/Welcome
https://health-family.force.com/s/Welcome
mailto:support-health@atamis.co.uk
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the document section. PLEASE SEND YOUR RESPONSE TO THE PIN VIA THE
ATAMIS PORTAL BY 9AM 03/05/2022

If you are a supplier who wishes to register please visit https://health-
family.force.com/s/Welcome

If you encounter any difficulties whilst using the portal you can contact the Support Team
on 029 2279 0052 or by emailing support-health@atamis.co.uk
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