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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009469-2025 

Planning

GLA 82743 - Preliminary Market Engagement - Warmer
Homes London - Domestic Retrofit Programme

Transport for London

UK2: Preliminary market engagement notice - Procurement Act 2023 - view information
about notice types 

Notice identifier: 2025/S 000-009469
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04ed61 (view related notices)
Published 14 March 2025, 2:17pm

Scope 

Reference

GLA 82743 / SAP Ariba Ref: WS2457571503

Description

The Greater London Authority (GLA), in partnership with London Councils, is conducting a
market engagement exercise to inform the potential procurement of services related to the
Warm Homes Local Grant (WH:LG) and other future initiatives under the Warmer Homes
London for which the GLA may secure funding.

The purpose of this engagement is to explore viable commissioning options and assess
market interest in delivering key services. The insights gained will help the GLA and our
partners shape any future procurement strategy.

The GLA seeks input from organisations with expertise in the retrofit sector to understand
capacity, market capability, and procurement considerations. This exercise will inform the
potential procurement route for:

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009469-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009469-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Home/NoticeTypes
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Home/NoticeTypes
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/procurement/ocds-h6vhtk-04ed61
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• Retrofit Managing Agent to oversee the programme, assess applications and manage
retrofit Contractors; and

• 4 Retrofit Contractors (including up to 3 reserves for each Lot) who will undertake
property assessments and installer the agreed improvements)

The appointed suppliers would support the delivery of retrofit works under government-
funded schemes. The market engagement exercise aims to:

• Gather market intelligence on potential service delivery models

• Identify opportunities and challenges within the supply chain

• Inform the design of any future procurement approach

Participation in this engagement will not preclude suppliers from taking part in any future
procurement process. The engagement is for information-gathering purposes only and
does not constitute a commitment to procure

Warmer Homes London: https://www.london.gov.uk/media-centre/mayors-press-releases/
warmer-homes-london-launches-help-vulnerable-londoners-heat-their-homes-and-save-
money#:~:text=WHL will make London's homes,programme is delivered at pace.

Total value (estimated)

£53,500,000 excluding VAT

£64,200,000 including VAT

Above the relevant threshold

Contract dates (estimated)

1 October 2025 to 30 September 2029

4 years

https://www.london.gov.uk/media-centre/mayors-press-releases/warmer-homes-london-launches-help-vulnerable-londoners-heat-their-homes-and-save-money#:~:text=WHL
https://www.london.gov.uk/media-centre/mayors-press-releases/warmer-homes-london-launches-help-vulnerable-londoners-heat-their-homes-and-save-money#:~:text=WHL
https://www.london.gov.uk/media-centre/mayors-press-releases/warmer-homes-london-launches-help-vulnerable-londoners-heat-their-homes-and-save-money#:~:text=WHL
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Main procurement category

Works

CPV classifications

09332000 - Solar installation

39715210 - Central-heating equipment

42511110 - Heat pumps

45000000 - Construction work

50700000 - Repair and maintenance services of building installations

71241000 - Feasibility study, advisory service, analysis

71250000 - Architectural, engineering and surveying services

71314200 - Energy-management services

71314300 - Energy-efficiency consultancy services

71315200 - Building consultancy services

71321200 - Heating-system design services

79342000 - Marketing services

Contract locations

UKI - London

Engagement 
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Engagement deadline

17 April 2025

Engagement process description

Interested organisations are invited to express their interest and contribute to the
engagement exercise.

A prospectus describing the requirement will be made available from Friday 21st March
2025 at 10:00 GMT to potential suppliers who register an interest against this -
Preliminary Market Engagement Notice.

The GLA is seeking input and feedback from potential suppliers on our initial delivery
model and early stage thinking - potential suppliers will be invited to take part in a
qualitative questionnaire based on the prospectus to be completed by Thursday 27th
March 2025 and a subsequent in-person event on Monday 31st March 2025.

The Authority may hold bilateral meetings with some of the potential suppliers, where we
are seeking further clarifications on the responses to the aforementioned qualitative
questionnaire. Any bilateral meetings with potential suppliers are likely to be held between
the 7th - 11th April 2025 via Microsoft Teams.

This activity is focusing on the market, rather than the merits of individual suppliers. It
includes no element of supplier selection or bid evaluation. There is no commitment of
any kind inferred by either party.

How to express interest:

The Authority will be using the TfL's instance of the SAP Ariba portal to manage
expressions of interest and all communications will be made through the Portal:

TfL has recently switched to a new sourcing system, SAP Ariba, meaning that TfL's
processes are now different to those that suppliers may be familiar with. The following
instructions explain this new system and provide guidance on how interested parties will
be able to communicate with TfL.

To login to SAP Ariba (for those organisations already registered):

https://service.ariba.com/Supplier.aw

To register: Please use TfL's specific Ariba registration page below:

https://service.ariba.com/Supplier.aw
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https://s1-eu.ariba.com/Sourcing/Main/ad/selfRegistration?realm=TfL

After registration or login: To participate in this tender you must register interest in this
event by emailing RobertEales@tfl.gov.uk and MeetaChohan@tfl.gov.uk

You will then receive an automated email from the SAP Ariba system with further
instructions.

Note: Once you have registered (or are already registered) your business on Ariba you
must email the commercial contact. Registering your business on Ariba is not the same as
registering your interest in this project.

For help registering on the SAP Ariba system and for checking if you are already
registered please refer to: https://content.tfl.gov.uk/supplier-registration.pdf

For guidance on using SAP Ariba please refer to: 
https://support.ariba.com/Adapt/Ariba_Network_Supplier_Training

If any problems persist please contact Ariba_Supplier_Enablement@tfl.gov.uk

Submission 

Publication date of tender notice (estimated)

1 June 2025

Contracting authority 

Transport for London

Public Procurement Organisation Number: PHMT-6197-NWNZ

https://s1-eu.ariba.com/Sourcing/Main/ad/selfRegistration?realm=TfL
mailto:RobertEales@tfl.gov.uk
mailto:MeetaChohan@tfl.gov.uk
https://content.tfl.gov.uk/supplier-registration.pdf
https://support.ariba.com/Adapt/Ariba_Network_Supplier_Training
mailto:Ariba_Supplier_Enablement@tfl.gov.uk
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5 Endeavour Square

London

E20 1JN

United Kingdom

Contact name: Robert Eales

Email: RobertEales@tfl.gov.uk

Website: http://www.london.gov.uk

Region: UKI41 - Hackney and Newham

Organisation type: Public authority - central government
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