
Page 1 to 5

  

This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009087-2025 

Planning

Road Haulage and Warehousing Services

NETWORK RAIL INFRASTRUCTURE LIMITED

UK2: Preliminary market engagement notice - Procurement Act 2023 - view information
about notice types 

Notice identifier: 2025/S 000-009087

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-04ec65 

Published 12 March 2025, 4:58pm

Scope 

Description

Network Rail has a requirement for the operation of a 24/7 road haulage service to manage
the collection, haulage and delivery (including loading and offloading) of materials by road.
Network Rail also has the requirement for warehousing management.

The purpose of this exercise is to engage the market, to gather information and understand
aspects of potential best practice to inform Network Rail's Tender process including
developing a specification and pricing model.

The key objectives of this activity are to:

1. Understand areas of efficiency and best practice to refine and inform Network Rail's
requirement to tender Road Haulage and Warehousing activities.

2. Understand the level of interest from the supply chain for the upcoming tender activity.

3. Allow the supply chain to have a view of Network Rail's specification and invite any
questions or suggestions for improvements.

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009087-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/009087-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Home/NoticeTypes
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Home/NoticeTypes
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4. Allow suppliers to visit one of our Regional Distribution Centres to provide clarity of the
operation to enable the best tender responses.

Network Rail has previously conducted Pre-Market Engagement under UCR(2016) : Notice
identifier: 2024/S 000-007584 - Published 8 March 2024, 4:06pm. This included
completion of specific questions relative to the requirement. A summary of questions asked
and responses shall be provided to all interested parties.

This Pre-Market engagement activity will include a site visit which shall be held on the 27th
March 2025. This shall be at Network Rail's Coventry Regional Distribution Centre. This shall
be limited to 2 people per organisation. 1 week before the site visit, a draft specification and
questionnaire shall be sent for review. The deadline for this pre-market engagement is
11/04/2025, a formal response is required from all interested parties by this date. This shall
include, comments on the draft specification and any comments on the material that was
presented on the day, also completion of the mentioned questionnaire.

Commercial tool

Establishes a framework

Total value (estimated)

£340,000,000 excluding VAT

£408,000,000 including VAT

Above the relevant threshold

Contract dates (estimated)

31 October 2026 to 31 October 2034

8 years, 1 day
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Main procurement category

Services

CPV classifications

60100000 - Road transport services

63122000 - Warehousing services

Contract locations

UK - United Kingdom

Engagement 

Engagement deadline

11 April 2025

Engagement process description

Site Visits 27/03/2025 including overview presentation.

11/04/2025, Deadline for Pre-Market Engagement including formal responses.
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Participation 

Particular suitability

Small and medium-sized enterprises (SME)

Voluntary, community and social enterprises (VCSE)

Submission 

Publication date of tender notice (estimated)

30 September 2025

Procedure 

Special regime

Utilities

Contracting authority 
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NETWORK RAIL INFRASTRUCTURE LIMITED

Public Procurement Organisation Number: PNZN-9524-VCQJ

Waterloo General Office

London

SE1 8SW

United Kingdom

Contact name: Aryan Dahihandekar

Telephone: 07702620306

Email: aryan.dahihandekar@networkrail.co.uk

Website: https://www.networkrail.co.uk/

Region: UKI45 - Lambeth

Organisation type: Public authority - central government
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