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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/006797-2024 

Tender

Universal Family Behaviour Change Programme

HAMPSHIRE COUNTY COUNCIL

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-006797

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-044509  

Published 4 March 2024, 10:40am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

HAMPSHIRE COUNTY COUNCIL

The Castle

WINCHESTER

SO238ZB

Contact

Martin Kelly

Email

martin.kelly@hants.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1962832153

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/006797-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/006797-2024
mailto:martin.kelly@hants.gov.uk
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Country

United Kingdom

Region code

UKJ36 - Central Hampshire

Justification for not providing organisation identifier

Not on any register

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.hants.gov.uk/

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Regional or local authority

I.5) Main activity

General public services

Section II: Object

https://www.hants.gov.uk/
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/hampshire/aspx/Home
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II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Universal Family Behaviour Change Programme

Reference number

AS22160

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85140000 - Miscellaneous health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

The delivery of an innovative pilot programme, to support families with children aged 2-12 to
make sustainable changes to their behaviours, lifestyles, and home environments, with the
aim of promoting healthy weight. It will be a preventive Universal Family Behaviour Change
service, to provide a focused, small-stepped intervention that supports families to kickstart
behaviour change by setting, achieving, and sustaining their own goals.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £325,225

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

75200000 - Provision of services to the community

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes
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UKJ35 - South Hampshire

UKJ36 - Central Hampshire

UKJ37 - North Hampshire

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The delivery of an innovative pilot programme, to support families with children aged 2-12 to
make sustainable changes to their behaviours, lifestyles, and home environments, with the
aim of promoting healthy weight. It will be a preventive Universal Family Behaviour Change
service, to provide a focused, small-stepped intervention that supports families to kickstart
behaviour change by setting, achieving, and sustaining their own goals.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.6) Estimated value

Value excluding VAT: £325,225

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing
system

Duration in months

40

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: No

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

4 April 2024

Local time

2:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

4 April 2024

Local time

2:01pm

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence
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This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

High Court of England and Wales

London

Country

United Kingdom

VI.4.3) Review procedure

Precise information on deadline(s) for review procedures

The Contracting Authority will incorporate a minimum ten (10) calendar days standstill
period at the point that information on the conclusion of the Contract is communicated to all
tenderers. This period allows any unsuccessful tenderer(s) to seek further debriefing
information from the Contracting Authority before the conclusion of the Contract. Such
additional information should be requested from the address at I.1 of this notice. If an appeal
regarding the conclusion of the Contract has not been successfully resolved, then the Public
Contracts Regulations 2015 (SI 2015/102) provide for aggrieved parties who have been

harmed or are at risk of harm by a breach of the rules to take action in the High Court
(England, Wales and Northern Ireland). Any such action must be started within thirty (30)
days beginning with the date when the aggrieved party first knew or ought to have known
that grounds for starting such proceedings had arisen. The Court may extend the time-limit
for starting proceedings where the Court considers that there is good reason for doing so,

but not so as to permit proceedings to be started more than three (3) months after that date.

Where the Contract has not been concluded, the Court may set aside the decision to award
the Contract or order the Contracting Authority to amend any document and may award
damages. If the Contract has been concluded, the Court may only award damages, or where
the award procedures have not been followed correctly, declare the Contract to be
ineffective.
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