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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/005368-2023 

Contract

National Framework for Medium Works 23

The Education Alliance

F03: Contract award notice

Notice identifier: 2023/S 000-005368
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-03443d  
Published 22 February 2023, 6:59pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

The Education Alliance

East Dale Road

Melton

HU14 3HS

Email

tenders@pagabo.co.uk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE12 - East Riding of Yorkshire

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/005368-2023
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/005368-2023
mailto:tenders@pagabo.co.uk
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https://theeducationalliance.org.uk

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Other type

Education

I.5) Main activity

Education

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

National Framework for Medium Works 23

Reference number

AVP-TEA-2002

II.1.2) Main CPV code

45000000 - Construction work

II.1.3) Type of contract

Works

II.1.4) Short description

Added Value Portal t/a Pagabo, acting on behalf of The Education Alliance, wish to
establish a national framework of Contractors for medium Works contracts within the UK
with values of between 50 000 GBP and 10 000 000 GBP. The framework will cover, but
is not limited to, new builds, extension, refurbishment and maintenance requirements. The
Framework Agreement will be established for a period of 3 years, with the option to
extend for a further period of up to 1 year, from January 2023. This Framework
Agreement is being advertised and tendered, so it can be utilised by all public-sector
bodies (including Charities) in the UK, the full list is available in the Tender synopsis on
the In- Tend portal – https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo). The framework is divided into 4

https://theeducationalliance.org.uk
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
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lots and 42 regions per lot, giving 168 sub-lots, which will operate with a maximum of 9
Contractors per sub-lot. The framework shall have the facility for Clients to Direct Award
and Further Compete their requirement

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: Yes

II.1.7) Total value of the procurement (excluding VAT)

Value excluding VAT: £1,000,000,000

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Lot 1 - Projects Between £50,000 and £500,000

Lot No

1

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

45000000 - Construction work

45400000 - Building completion work

45100000 - Site preparation work

45234000 - Construction work for railways and cable transport systems

45260000 - Roof works and other special trade construction works

45210000 - Building construction work

45251000 - Construction works for power plants and heating plants

45233000 - Construction, foundation and surface works for highways, roads

45200000 - Works for complete or part construction and civil engineering work

45231100 - General construction work for pipelines

45222100 - Waste-treatment plant construction work

45240000 - Construction work for water projects
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45236000 - Flatwork

45300000 - Building installation work

45221000 - Construction work for bridges and tunnels, shafts and subways

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

This lot is for the provision of Works projects between £50,000 and £500,000.Added
Value Portal t/a Pagabo, acting on behalf of The Education Alliance, wish to establish a
national framework of Contractors for medium Works contracts within the UK with values
of between 50 000 GBP and 10 000 000 GBP. The framework will cover, but is not limited
to, new builds, extension, refurbishment and maintenance requirements. The Framework
Agreement will be established for a period of 3 years, with the option to extend for a
further period of up to 1 year. This Framework Agreement is being advertised and
tendered, so it can be utilised by all public-sector bodies (including Charities) in the UK,
the full list is available in the Tender synopsis on the In- Tend portal – https://in-
tendhost.co.uk/pagabo). The framework is divided into 4 lots and 42 regions per lot, giving
168 sub-lots, which will each operate with a maximum of 9 Contractors per sub-lot. The
framework shall have the facility for Clients to Direct Award and Further Compete their
requirement.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Lot 2 - Projects Between £500,000 and £1,000,000

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
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Lot No

2

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

45000000 - Construction work

45400000 - Building completion work

45100000 - Site preparation work

45234000 - Construction work for railways and cable transport systems

45260000 - Roof works and other special trade construction works

45210000 - Building construction work

45251000 - Construction works for power plants and heating plants

45223300 - Parking lot construction work

45233000 - Construction, foundation and surface works for highways, roads

45200000 - Works for complete or part construction and civil engineering work

45231100 - General construction work for pipelines

45222100 - Waste-treatment plant construction work

45240000 - Construction work for water projects

45236000 - Flatwork

45300000 - Building installation work

45221000 - Construction work for bridges and tunnels, shafts and subways

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

This lot is for the provision of Works projects between £500,000 and £1,000,000, example
types of work, but not limited to, Whole site refurbishments, Double/Triple room
extensions, Small sports halls, Other works within the value rangeAdded Value Portal t/a
Pagabo, acting on behalf of The Education Alliance, wish to establish a national
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framework of Contractors for medium Works contracts within the UK with values of
between 50 000 GBP and 10 000 000 GBP. The framework will cover, but is not limited
to, new builds, extension, refurbishment and maintenance requirements. The Framework
Agreement will be established for a period of 3 years, with the option to extend for a
further period of up to 1 year. This Framework Agreement is being advertised and
tendered, so it can be utilised by all public-sector bodies (including Charities) in the UK,
the full list is available in the Tender synopsis on the In- Tend portal – https://in-
tendhost.co.uk/pagabo). The framework is divided into 4 lots and 42 regions per lot, giving
168 sub-lots, which will each operate with a maximum of 9 Contractors per sub-lot. The
framework shall have the facility for Clients to Direct Award and Further Compete their
requirement.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Lot 2 - Projects Between £1,000,000 and £5,000,000

Lot No

3

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

45000000 - Construction work

45400000 - Building completion work

45100000 - Site preparation work

45234000 - Construction work for railways and cable transport systems

45260000 - Roof works and other special trade construction works

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
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45210000 - Building construction work

45251000 - Construction works for power plants and heating plants

45223300 - Parking lot construction work

45233000 - Construction, foundation and surface works for highways, roads

45200000 - Works for complete or part construction and civil engineering work

45231100 - General construction work for pipelines

45222100 - Waste-treatment plant construction work

45240000 - Construction work for water projects

45236000 - Flatwork

45300000 - Building installation work

45221000 - Construction work for bridges and tunnels, shafts and subways

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

This lot is for the provision of Works projects between £1,000,000 to £5,000,000. Example
types of work, but not limited to, Large extensions, Department builds, Leisure Centres /
Large sports halls, Other works within the value rangeAdded Value Portal t/a Pagabo,
acting on behalf of The Education Alliance, wish to establish a national framework of
Contractors for medium Works contracts within the UK with values of between 50 000
GBP and 10 000 000 GBP. The framework will cover, but is not limited to, new builds,
extension, refurbishment and maintenance requirements. The Framework Agreement will
be established for a period of 3 years, with the option to extend for a further period of up
to 1 year. This Framework Agreement is being advertised and tendered, so it can be
utilised by all public-sector bodies (including Charities) in the UK, the full list is available in
the Tender synopsis on the In- Tend portal – https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo). The
framework is divided into 4 lots and 42 regions per lot, giving 168 sub-lots, which will each
operate with a maximum of 9 Contractors per sub-lot. The framework shall have the
facility for Clients to Direct Award and Further Compete their requirement.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price 

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
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II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2) Description

II.2.1) Title

Lot 4 - Projects Between £5,000,000 and £10,000,000

Lot No

4

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

45000000 - Construction work

45400000 - Building completion work

45100000 - Site preparation work

45234000 - Construction work for railways and cable transport systems

45260000 - Roof works and other special trade construction works

45210000 - Building construction work

45251000 - Construction works for power plants and heating plants

45223300 - Parking lot construction work

45233000 - Construction, foundation and surface works for highways, roads

45200000 - Works for complete or part construction and civil engineering work

45231100 - General construction work for pipelines

45222100 - Waste-treatment plant construction work

45240000 - Construction work for water projects

45236000 - Flatwork
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45300000 - Building installation work

45221000 - Construction work for bridges and tunnels, shafts and subways

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

This lot is for the provision of Work projects between £5,000,000 and £10,000,000.
Example types of work, but not limited to, Multi-room buildings and extensions, Whole site
builds, Other works within the value rangeAdded Value Portal t/a Pagabo, acting on
behalf of The Education Alliance, wish to establish a national framework of Contractors for
medium Works contracts within the UK with for projects with values of between 50 000
GBP and 10 000 000 GBP. The framework will cover, but is not limited to, new builds,
extension, refurbishment and maintenance requirements. The Framework Agreement will
be established for a period of 3 years, with the option to extend for a further period of up
to 1 year. This Framework Agreement is being advertised and tendered, so it can be
utilised by all public-sector bodies (including Charities) in the UK, the full list is available in
the Tender synopsis on the In- Tend portal – https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo). The
framework is divided into 4 lots and 42 regions per lot, giving 168 sub-lots, which will each
operate with a maximum of 9 Contractors per sub-lot. The framework shall have the
facility for Clients to Direct Award and Further Compete their requirement.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/pagabo
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.3) Information about a framework agreement or a dynamic purchasing system

The procurement involves the establishment of a framework agreement

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2022/S 000-021581

Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

AVP-TEA-2002

Lot No

1

Title

Projects of £50k to £500k

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

17 January 2023

/Notice/021581-2022
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V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 66 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 55 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 66 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amey Community Limited

London

EC4A 1AB

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ash Contracting Ltd 

Pimlico

SW1V 4PS

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ballast Nedam Parking Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Bermar Building Co Ltd

Bradford

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE41 - Bradford

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Borras Construction Ltd

St Albans

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH23 - Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Britcon (UK) Limited

Scunthorpe

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE13 - North and North East Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Building Services Now Ltd

Aldridge

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

C Watkins Plumbing

Kent

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ4 - Kent

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Camelcrest Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH23 - Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

CBES Ltd
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Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM82 - Glasgow City

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Classic Builders (South West) Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Conamar Building Services

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH23 - Hertfordshire
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The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

D&G Builders and Joiners Ltd

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Diamond Build Plc

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

E G Carte & Co Ltd

Gloucester
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK13 - Gloucestershire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

EW Beard Ltd

Wiltshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

F Parkinson Limited

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME
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Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Foster Property Maintenance Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

FP McCann Ltd

Derry

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Geoffrey Robinson Limited

Cleveland

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC1 - Tees Valley and Durham

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Greenmount Projects Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

GS Kelsey Construction Ltd

North Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE13 - North and North East Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

H&J Martin Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Helix CMS Limited

Hull

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE11 - Kingston upon Hull, City of

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Hobson & Porter Limited

East Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKE1 - East Yorkshire and Northern Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Houghton & Son Ltd

Essex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Inside Out Developments Ltd

Oxfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ14 - Oxfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Jeakins Weir Ltd.

Northhamptonshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Krol Corlett Construction Ltd

Merseyside

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD7 - Merseyside

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Lindum Group

Lincolnshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Maurice Flynn & Sons Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

MC Designers Group Ltd

West Sussex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Meldrum Construction Services Group Ltd
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Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Morris and Spottiswood Ltd

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM82 - Glasgow City

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Mountjoy Ltd.

Hampshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ3 - Hampshire and Isle of Wight
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Nevada Construction Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

RJ McLeod (Contractors) Limited

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM82 - Glasgow City

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Seddon Construction Limtied

Bolton
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Sewell Construction Ltd

East Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE1 - East Yorkshire and Northern Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Speller Metcalfe Malvern Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME
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No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

T&B (Contractors) Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Sudlows Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Thomas Sinden Limited

Essex

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tom Willoughby Ltd 

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Topcon Building Ltd

North East Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

William Birch & Sons Ltd

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Initial estimated total value of the contract/lot: £50,000,000

Total value of the contract/lot: £50,000,000

Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

AVP-TEA-2002

Lot No

2

Title

Projects of £500k to £1m

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract
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17 January 2023

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 78 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 65 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 78 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Alcema Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG1 - Herefordshire, Worcestershire and Warwickshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amey Community Limited

London

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Arc Group London Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ash Contracting Ltd 

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Ashe Construction Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Bermar Building Co Ltd

Bradford

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE41 - Bradford

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Borras Construction Limited

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Breheny Civil Engineering Ltd

Suffolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH14 - Suffolk

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Britcon (UK) Limited

North Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Building Services Now Ltd
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Aldridge

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Camelcrest Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH23 - Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

CBES Ltd

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Classic Builders (South West) Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Conamar Building Services

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Construction North Group Ltd

Bingley
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE4 - West Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

D&G Builders and Joiners Ltd

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Diamond Build Plc

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME
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Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

E G Carte & Co Ltd

Gloucester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK13 - Gloucestershire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

E Manton Limited

West Midlands

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

EW Beard Ltd

Wiltshire

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

F Parkinson Limited

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fleming Buildings Ltd

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Foster Property Maintenance Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

FP McCann Ltd

Derry

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

G F Tomlinson Building Limited

Derbyshire

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKF1 - Derbyshire and Nottinghamshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Greenmount Projects Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

H&J Martin Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Helix CMS Limited

Hull

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE1 - East Yorkshire and Northern Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Hobson & Porter Limited

Hull

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE1 - East Yorkshire and Northern Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Houghton & Son Ltd

Essex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Interclass Plc

West Midlands

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Jeakins Weir Ltd.

Northhamptonshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Krol Corlett Construction Ltd
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Merseyside

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD7 - Merseyside

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Lindum Group

Lincolnshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Maurice Flynn & Sons Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast
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The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

MC Designers Group Ltd

Sussex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Meldrum Construction Services Group Ltd

Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Morris and Spottiswood Ltd

Glasgow
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Mountjoy Ltd.

Hampshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ3 - Hampshire and Isle of Wight

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Nevada Construction Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME



Page 46 to 98

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ogilvie Group Ltd

Stirlingshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

R G Carter Cambridge Ltd 

Norfolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH15 - Norwich and East Norfolk

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

RJ McLeod (Contractors) Limited

Glasgow

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Seddon Construction Limtied

Bolton

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

SEH French Limited

Suffolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH14 - Suffolk

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Sewell Construction Ltd

East Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE1 - East Yorkshire and Northern Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Speller Metcalfe Malvern Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG1 - Herefordshire, Worcestershire and Warwickshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Sudlows Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Sunninghill Construction Co Limited

East Sussex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

T&B (Contractors) Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Thomas Sinden Limited

Essex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tom Willoughby Ltd 

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Topcon Building Ltd

North East Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKE13 - North and North East Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Triton Construction Ltd

West Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE4 - West Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Walter Carefoot & Sons (Construction) Ltd.

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Walter Thompson Contractors
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North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

William Birch & Sons Ltd

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Initial estimated total value of the contract/lot: £190,000,000

Total value of the contract/lot: £190,000,000
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Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

AVP-TEA-2002

Lot No

3

Title

Projects of £1m to £5m

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

17 January 2023

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 104 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 76 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 104 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

8 build Limited

London

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Alcema Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG1 - Herefordshire, Worcestershire and Warwickshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amey Community Limited

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

No
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amiri Construction Ltd

Hampshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ3 - Hampshire and Isle of Wight

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ash Contracting Ltd 

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ashe Construction Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ballast Nedam Parking Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Baxall Construction

Kent

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ4 - Kent

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Bray & Slaughter Ltd

Bristol

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Britcon (UK) Limited

North Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

C. Wynne & Sons Limited 

Denbighshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKL13 - Conwy and Denbighshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

CCG (SCOTLAND) LTD

Lanarkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM95 - South Lanarkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Classic Builders (South West) Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Conlon Construction Limited 
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Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

D&G Builders and Joiners Ltd

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Eric Wright Construction Ltd

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Esh Construction Limited

Durham

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC1 - Tees Valley and Durham

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

EW Beard Ltd

Wiltshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

F Parkinson Limited

Lancashire
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Felix O'Hare & Co. Ltd

Co.Down

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Fleming Buildings Ltd

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME
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Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

FP McCann Ltd

Derry

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

G F Tomlinson Building Limited

Derbyshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF1 - Derbyshire and Nottinghamshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Geoffrey Robinson Limited

Cleveland

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC1 - Tees Valley and Durham

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Goldbeck Construction Ltd.

Birmingham

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

H&J Martin Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Henry Boot Construction Limited 

South Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE3 - South Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Henry Brothers Midlands Limited

Derry

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Jeakins Weir Ltd.

Northhamptonshire

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

JN Bentley Ltd

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kier Construction Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Krol Corlett Construction Ltd

Merseyside

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD7 - Merseyside

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Lindum Group

Lincolnshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Linear Design & Construct (Scotland) 

North Lanarkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Logan Construction SE Ltd

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Maurice Flynn & Sons Ltd

Belfast

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN06 - Belfast

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

McPhillips (Wellington) Limited
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Shropshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG2 - Shropshire and Staffordshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Meldrum Construction Services Group Ltd

Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Morgan Sindall Construction & Infrastructure Ltd

Sheffield

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE3 - South Yorkshire
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Morris and Spottiswood Ltd

Lanarkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Neilcott Contruction Ltd

Kent

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ4 - Kent

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Nevada Construction Limited

Devon
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ogilvie Group Ltd

Stirlingshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Pentaco Construction Limited

Norfolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH1 - East Anglia

The contractor is an SME
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Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

R G Carter Cambridge Ltd 

Norfolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH1 - East Anglia

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

RJ McLeod (Contractors) Limited

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Russells Ltd trading as Russell WBHO 

Manchester

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Seddon Construction Limtied

Bolton

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

SEH French Limited

Suffolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH14 - Suffolk

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Speller Metcalfe Malvern Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG1 - Herefordshire, Worcestershire and Warwickshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

T&B (Contractors) Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Thomas Sinden Limited

Essex

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tilbury Douglas Construction Limited

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tolent Construction Limited

Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Triton Construction Ltd

West Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE4 - West Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

VINCI Construction UK Limited

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Walter Carefoot & Sons (Construction) Ltd.

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Walter Thompson Contractors

North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Wates Construction Limited

Surrey

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

William Birch & Sons Ltd
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North Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE2 - North Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Initial estimated total value of the contract/lot: £390,000,000

Total value of the contract/lot: £390,000,000
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Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

AVP-TEA-2002

Lot No

4

Title

Projects of £5m to £10m

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

17 January 2023

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 64 

Number of tenders received from SMEs: 35 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from other EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received from tenderers from non-EU Member States: 0 

Number of tenders received by electronic means: 64 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

8 build Limited

London

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amey Community Limited

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Amiri Construction Ltd

Hampshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ3 - Hampshire and Isle of Wight

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ashe Construction Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Baxall Construction

Kent

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ4 - Kent

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Britcon (UK) Limited

North Lincolnshire 

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Buckingham Group Contracting Ltd

Buckinghamshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ1 - Berkshire, Buckinghamshire and Oxfordshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

C. Wynne & Sons Limited 

Denbighshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKL13 - Conwy and Denbighshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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CCG (SCOTLAND) LTD

Lanarkshire 

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM95 - South Lanarkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Classic Builders (South West) Limited

Devon

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK4 - Devon

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

 Conlon Construction Limited 

Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Diamond Build Plc

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

E G Carte & Co Ltd

Gloucestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Eric Wright Construction Ltd
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Lancashire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD4 - Lancashire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Esh Construction Limited

Durham

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

EW Beard Ltd

Wiltshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKK1 - Gloucestershire, Wiltshire and Bristol/Bath area
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Felix O'Hare & Co. Ltd

Co.Down

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

FP McCann Ltd

Derry

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

G F Tomlinson Building Limited

Derbyshire
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF1 - Derbyshire and Nottinghamshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Geoffrey Robinson Limited

Cleveland

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

GMI Construction Group Plc

West Yorkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE4 - West Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME
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No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Goldbeck Construction Ltd.

Birmingham

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG3 - West Midlands

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Henry Boot Construction Limited 

Sheffield

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE3 - South Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Henry Brothers Midlands Limited

Derry

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKN - Northern Ireland

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Jarvis Contracting Ltd

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Jeakins Weir Ltd.

Northhamptonshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF2 - Leicestershire, Rutland and Northamptonshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes
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V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Kier Construction Limited

Greater Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Lindum Group

Lincolnshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKF3 - Lincolnshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

McLaren Construction Ltd.

Essex

Country

United Kingdom
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NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

McPhillips (Wellington) Limited

Shropshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG2 - Shropshire and Staffordshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Meldrum Construction Services Group Ltd

Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor
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Morgan Sindall Construction & Infrastructure Ltd

Sheffield

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE3 - South Yorkshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Morris and Spottiswood Ltd

Lanarkshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Neilcott Contruction Ltd

Kent

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code
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UKJ4 - Kent

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Ogilvie Group Ltd

Stirlingshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Pentaco Construction Limited

Norfolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH1 - East Anglia

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

R G Carter Cambridge Ltd 
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Norfolk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH1 - East Anglia

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

RJ McLeod (Contractors) Limited

Glasgow

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - Scotland

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Russells Ltd trading as Russell WBHO 

Manchester

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester
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The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Seddon Construction Limtied

Bolton

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKD3 - Greater Manchester

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Speller Metcalfe Malvern Limited

Worcestershire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKG1 - Herefordshire, Worcestershire and Warwickshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

T&B (Contractors) Ltd

Hertfordshire
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Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Thomas Sinden Limited

Essex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH3 - Essex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tilbury Douglas Construction Limited

London

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKI - London

The contractor is an SME
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No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Tolent Construction Limited

Tyne and Wear

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKC2 - Northumberland and Tyne and Wear

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

VINCI Construction UK Limited

Hertfordshire

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKH2 - Bedfordshire and Hertfordshire

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Wates Construction Limited

Surrey

Country
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

Westridge Construction Ltd

East Sussex

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKJ2 - Surrey, East and West Sussex

The contractor is an SME

Yes

V.2.4) Information on value of contract/lot (excluding VAT)

Initial estimated total value of the contract/lot: £370,000,000

Total value of the contract/lot: £370,000,000
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

A detailed overview of all awarded sub-lot allocations per region is available to access via
the link below. Please refer to page 13 onwards. 
https://www.pagabo.co.uk/storage/uploads/2023-mediumworks_ug-digital.pdf

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

High Courts of England Wales

London

Country

United Kingdom
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