
Page 1 to 7

  

This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/004603-2021 

Contract

Treatment of Bio Resource (Sludge)

Scottish Water

F06: Contract award notice – utilities

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-004603
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02996c  
Published 8 March 2021, 2:32pm

Section I: Contracting entity

I.1) Name and addresses

Scottish Water

6 Buchanan Gate

Glasgow

G33 6FB

Contact

Nicola Young

Email

nicola.young@scottishwater.co.uk

Telephone

+44 7825203975

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/004603-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/004603-2021
mailto:nicola.young@scottishwater.co.uk


Page 2 to 7

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - SCOTLAND

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.scottishwater.co.uk

I.6) Main activity

Water

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Treatment of Bio Resource (Sludge)

Reference number

SW20/S&W/1318

II.1.2) Main CPV code

90513800 - Sludge treatment services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Scottish Water is seeking to appoint suppliers to de-water and treat wastewater liquid
sludge.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

https://www.scottishwater.co.uk
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II.2) Description

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKM - SCOTLAND

Main site or place of performance

SCOTLAND

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

Scottish Water is seeking to appoint suppliers to de-water and treat wastewater liquid
sludge producing a product that meets an enhanced treated standard, as defined in the
requirements of the Safe Sludge Matrix, at our waste water treatment sites at Kinneil
Kerse (Grangemouth) and Perth. The supplier must conform to the Bio-solids Assurance
Scheme and comply with Hazard Analysis and Critical Control Points (HACCP) plans for
each site and ensure the final product meets the criteria of the Safe Sludge Matrix. The
supplier must produce an odour management plan, which satisfies Scottish Water, SEPA
(Waste Management Licence) and Local Authority (The Odour Code of Practice) and
adhere to this for the duration of the contract. The supplier may also be required to
provide the provision of labour for Emergency dewatering activities at Sheildhall WWTW,
using SW owned equipment. Scottish Water would in all cases organise the transport and
recycling of the enhanced product to agriculture.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No

II.2.14) Additional information

The PQQ documents can also be accessed by logging in through the Scottish Water
Delta e-sourcing webpage https://www.delta-esourcing.com and through the Response
Manager section using the following Access Code: 7299E86J36

https://www.delta-esourcing.com
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Negotiated procedure with prior call for competition

IV.1.3) Information about a framework agreement or a dynamic purchasing system

The procurement involves the establishment of a framework agreement

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2020/S 125-307373

Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

SW20/S&W/1318

A contract/lot is awarded: Yes

V.2) Award of contract

V.2.1) Date of conclusion of the contract

9 February 2021

V.2.2) Information about tenders

Number of tenders received: 4 

The contract has been awarded to a group of economic operators: No

V.2.3) Name and address of the contractor

https://ted.europa.eu/udl?uri=TED:NOTICE:307373-2020:TEXT:EN:HTML
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Veolia Water Outsourcing Ltd

210 Pentonville Road

London

N1 9JY

Email

jane.winslow@veolia.com

Telephone

+44 7557289048

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKM - SCOTLAND

National registration number

02518607

The contractor is an SME

No

mailto:jane.winslow@veolia.com
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

Scottish Water will not accept the ESPD. We will only accept a completed Scottish Water
PQQ document. This Notice does not preclude Scottish Water from issuing other notices
for specific requirements. Responses to the OJEU Notice will be evaluated and only
successful applicants following PQQ evaluation will be invited to submit a tender. Scottish
Water reserves the right to divide the scope of the contract into lots at tender and contract
award stages as it deems appropriate. Applicants who fail to supply all of the information
requested in response to this Notice or any resulting tender exercise may risk elimination

To view this notice, please click here: 

https://scottishwater.delta-esourcing.com/delta/viewNotice.html?noticeId=576983248

 GO Reference: GO-202138-PRO-17895674

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

Glasgow Sheriff Court

1 Carlton Place

Glasgow

G5 9DA

Email

glasgow@scotcourts.gov.uk

Telephone

+44 1414298888

Country

United Kingdom

VI.4.2) Body responsible for mediation procedures

https://scottishwater.delta-esourcing.com/delta/viewNotice.html?noticeId=576983248
mailto:glasgow@scotcourts.gov.uk
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Scottish Water

6 Buchanan Gate

Glasgow

G33 6FB

Telephone

+44 8000778778

Country

United Kingdom
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