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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/002991-2021 

Tender

University of Hull - Stratified Flow Flume

University of Hull

F02: Contract notice

Notice identifier: 2021/S 000-002991
Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-029316  
Published 15 February 2021, 9:26am

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

University of Hull

Hull

HU6 7RX

Contact

Charlotte White

Email

C.A.White@hull.ac.uk

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UKE11 - Kingston upon Hull, City of

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/002991-2021
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/002991-2021
mailto:C.A.White@hull.ac.uk
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Internet address(es)

Main address

www.hull.ac.uk

I.3) Communication

The procurement documents are available for unrestricted and full direct access, free of
charge, at

https://www.proactisplaza.com/BuyerPortal/?orgid=UNIHULL

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

Tenders or requests to participate must be submitted electronically via

https://www.proactisplaza.com/BuyerPortal/?orgid=UNIHULL

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Education

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

University of Hull - Stratified Flow Flume

Reference number

DN209

II.1.2) Main CPV code

38420000 - Instruments for measuring flow, level and pressure of liquids and gases

II.1.3) Type of contract

http://www.hull.ac.uk
https://www.proactisplaza.com/BuyerPortal/?orgid=UNIHULL
https://www.proactisplaza.com/BuyerPortal/?orgid=UNIHULL
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Supplies

II.1.4) Short description

The Energy and Environment Institute (EEI) established in late 2016 at the University of
Hull brings together the skills and capabilities of leading researchers to tackle global
challenges related to climate change and population growth and their consequences for
society and livelihoods. The Institute has three primary goals: to research and discover; to
innovate and deliver impact; and to act as a regional anchor. The Energy and
Environment Institute has a variety of applied and basic research clusters, one of which is
the Centre of Environmental Fluid Dynamics. As we continue to grow and deliver research
that matters, we are investing in our facilities and research capabilities into a new type of
experimental facility that is required to study and measure stratified flow dynamics. The
facility should be capable of maintaining specified density stratification, and flow velocity
profiles, within a specified working section to understand the role of inherent density
variation in natural and industrial flows.

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: 200,000 EUR

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

71320000 - Engineering design services

38421000 - Flow-measuring equipment

45252121 - Sedimentation installations

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UKE11 - Kingston upon Hull, City of

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

The Energy and Environment Institute (EEI) established in late 2016 at the University of
Hull brings together the skills and capabilities of leading researchers to tackle global
challenges related to climate change and population growth and their consequences for
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society and livelihoods. The Institute has three primary goals: to research and discover; to
innovate and deliver impact; and to act as a regional anchor. The Energy and
Environment Institute has a variety of applied and basic research clusters, one of which is
the Centre of Environmental Fluid Dynamics. As we continue to grow and deliver research
that matters, we are investing in our facilities and research capabilities into a new type of
experimental facility that is required to study and measure stratified flow dynamics. The
facility should be capable of maintaining specified density stratification, and flow velocity
profiles, within a specified working section to understand the role of inherent density
variation in natural and industrial flows.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Price is not the only award criterion and all criteria are stated only in the procurement
documents

II.2.7) Duration of the contract, framework agreement or dynamic purchasing system

End date

31 December 2021

This contract is subject to renewal

No

II.2.10) Information about variants

Variants will be accepted: Yes

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: Yes

Identification of the project

NERC
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.2) Time limit for receipt of tenders or requests to participate

Date

19 March 2021

Local time

12:00pm

IV.2.4) Languages in which tenders or requests to participate may be submitted

English

IV.2.7) Conditions for opening of tenders

Date

19 March 2021

Local time

12:05pm
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.1) Information about recurrence

This is a recurrent procurement: No

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

University of Hull

Hull

Email

C.A.White@hull.ac.uk

Country

United Kingdom
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