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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000566-2025 

Contract

Provision of an Out of Hours Community Crisis Support
Centre for BCUHB

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership-Procurement Services (hosted by Velindre
University NHS Trust)

F03: Contract award notice

Notice identifier: 2025/S 000-000566

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-02c9d6  

Published 8 January 2025, 4:18pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership-Procurement Services (hosted by Velindre
University NHS Trust)

4-5 Charnwood Court,, Heol Billingsley, Parc Nantgarw

Cardiff

CF15 7QZ

Email

deborah.evans6@wales.nhs.uk

Telephone

+44 1443848585

Country

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000566-2025
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000566-2025
mailto:deborah.evans6@wales.nhs.uk
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United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

Internet address(es)

Main address

http://nwssp.nhs.wales/ourservices/procurement-services/

Buyer's address

https://www.sell2wales.gov.wales/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA0221

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Health

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

Provision of an Out of Hours Community Crisis Support Centre for BCUHB

Reference number

BCU-OJEU-47815

II.1.2) Main CPV code

85323000 - Community health services

II.1.3) Type of contract

http://nwssp.nhs.wales/ourservices/procurement-services/
https://www.sell2wales.gov.wales/search/Search_AuthProfile.aspx?ID=AA0221
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Services

II.1.4) Short description

-To develop a service that provides one to one support to people at risk of deteriorating
mental health, in a welcoming and homely environment within the East Area. It will offer a
place to go for people experiencing mental distress and their families for advice, support and
the availability of a non-health based place of safety in line with the Crisis Care Concordat.

-To provide the above support during times at which most other mental health and support
based services are closed.

-To sign post and broker support to people requiring support and advice along with frequent
users of this service and other mental health services.

-To develop a Community resource, to stop admitting people to hospital when it isn’t the
best option and provide support in the community when people need time away from home,
extra support or protection.

-Promote recovery and resilience, providing services that don’t purely focus on treating or
managing symptoms, but instead help people to live independent, fulfilling lives with the
help and support they need.

-To work closely with other Mental Health Services such as Local Primary Mental Health
Support Service (LPMHSS) and Community Mental Health Teams (CHMT) for the benefit of
service users.

Please see Information for Bidders document on Bravo Solutions for further details.

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

85100000 - Health services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes
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UKL13 - Conwy and Denbighshire

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) are inviting a proposal from providers to
deliver a mobile Lithotripsy service predominately for the treatment of renal stones. To be
delivered from the BCUHB hospital site on Friday afternoons between 1pm and 5pm every
fortnight.

All Services provided under the contract must be provided by an accredited individual, and
all staff involved in service delivery will be of skilled experience and accreditation to carry out
the procedures listed.

Please see Information for Bidders document on Bravo Solutions for further details.

II.2.5) Award criteria

Quality criterion - Name: Quality / Weighting: 70

Price - Weighting: 30 

II.2.11) Information about options

Options: No

II.2.13) Information about European Union Funds

The procurement is related to a project and/or programme financed by European Union
funds: No
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.1) Type of procedure

Open procedure

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: Yes

IV.2) Administrative information

IV.2.1) Previous publication concerning this procedure

Notice number: 2021/S 000-017001

Section V. Award of contract

Contract No

BCU-OJEU-47815

A contract/lot is awarded: No

V.1) Information on non-award

The contract/lot is not awarded

No tenders or requests to participate were received or all were rejected

/Notice/017001-2021
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Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

(WA Ref:147177)

VI.4) Procedures for review

VI.4.1) Review body

High Court

Royal Courts of Justice, The Strand

London

WC2A 2LL

Telephone

+44 2079477501

Country

United Kingdom
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