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This is a published notice on the Find a Tender service: https://www.find-
tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000153-2024 

Planning

Sewage Treatment Plant Maintenance Services -
Market Engagement Survey

Aster Group Limited

F01: Prior information notice

Prior information only  

Notice identifier: 2024/S 000-000153

Procurement identifier (OCID): ocds-h6vhtk-042a8c  

Published 3 January 2024, 3:58pm

Section I: Contracting authority

I.1) Name and addresses

Aster Group Limited 

Sarsen Court

Devizes

SN10 2AZ

Contact

Samraj Randhawa

Email

samraj.randhawa@aster.co.uk

Telephone

https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000153-2024
https://www.find-tender.service.gov.uk/Notice/000153-2024
mailto:samraj.randhawa@aster.co.uk
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+44 3334008222

Country

United Kingdom

NUTS code

UK - United Kingdom

National registration number

n/a

Internet address(es)

Main address

https://www.aster.co.uk/

Buyer's address

https://in-tendhost.co.uk/aster/aspx/Login

I.3) Communication

Additional information can be obtained from the above-mentioned address

I.4) Type of the contracting authority

Body governed by public law

I.5) Main activity

Housing and community amenities

Section II: Object

II.1) Scope of the procurement

II.1.1) Title

https://www.aster.co.uk/
https://in-tendhost.co.uk/aster/aspx/Login
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Sewage Treatment Plant Maintenance Services - Market Engagement Survey

Reference number

1

II.1.2) Main CPV code

90420000 - Sewage treatment services

II.1.3) Type of contract

Services

II.1.4) Short description

Aster Group Ltd (�Aster�) is issuing this Prior Information Notice (PIN) to invite suppliers
to participate in a Market Engagement Survey, in support of Aster’s future requirements and
procurement for Sewage Treatment Plant Maintenance services across Hampshire,
Wiltshire, Somerset, Dorset, Devon and Cornwall. Aster would like to invite interested
companies to complete and submit the Market Engagement Survey via the following link: 
https://www.cxfb.co.uk/surveypreview/8A0E2818/trueThe deadline to complete the
Market Engagement Survey is 12 noon, Friday 26th January 2024. Following receipt of
completed surveys, Aster will review responses to inform the future procurement approach.
The scope is considered suitable for companies that are small or medium enterprises (SME)
as well as larger enterprises. 

II.1.5) Estimated total value

Value excluding VAT: £1

II.1.6) Information about lots

This contract is divided into lots: No

II.2) Description

II.2.2) Additional CPV code(s)

90420000 - Sewage treatment services

90400000 - Sewage services

https://www.cxfb.co.uk/surveypreview/8A0E2818/trueThe
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45252130 - Sewage plant equipment

34144520 - Sewage tankers

45232421 - Sewage treatment works

90490000 - Sewer survey and sewage treatment consultancy services

42122220 - Sewage pumps

90492000 - Sewage treatment consultancy services

90000000 - Sewage, refuse, cleaning and environmental services

90430000 - Sewage disposal services

II.2.3) Place of performance

NUTS codes

UK - United Kingdom

Main site or place of performance

Sewage Treatment Plant Maintenance services across Hampshire, Wiltshire, Somerset,
Dorset, Devon and Cornwall regions. 

II.2.4) Description of the procurement

Aster Group Ltd (�Aster�) is issuing this Prior Information Notice (PIN) to invite suppliers
to participate in a Market Engagement Survey, in support of Aster’s future requirements and
procurement for Sewage Treatment Plant Maintenance services across Hampshire,
Wiltshire, Somerset, Dorset, Devon and Cornwall regions. Aster would like to invite
interested companies to complete and submit the Market Engagement Survey via the
following link: https://www.cxfb.co.uk/surveypreview/8A0E2818/trueThe deadline to
complete the Market Engagement Survey is 12 noon, Friday 26th January 2024. Following
receipt of completed surveys, Aster will review responses to inform the future procurement
approach. The scope is considered suitable for companies that are small or medium
enterprises (SME) as well as larger enterprises. 

II.3) Estimated date of publication of contract notice

10 March 2024

https://www.cxfb.co.uk/surveypreview/8A0E2818/trueThe
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Section IV. Procedure

IV.1) Description

IV.1.8) Information about the Government Procurement Agreement (GPA)

The procurement is covered by the Government Procurement Agreement: No

Section VI. Complementary information

VI.3) Additional information

In issuing this PIN and engaging with the market, Aster Group Ltd is not committing to
conduct any procurement in relation to any element of the requirements within the
categories stated.Equally, non-participation in this market engagement event will not be
taken into account in any future procurement activities and will not exclude any organisation
from submitting a tender in any future competitions.It is currently anticipated that any formal
procurement relating to the provision of STP maintenance categories will be subject to
Public Contracts Regulations (PCR) 2015.
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